BID RESULTS

AB2013-50 JANITORIAL SERVICESS FOR 1589 LAMBERTON STREET AND 1 JOHNSTON AVENUE, TRENTON, NJ

10/9/2013

THREE YEARS EXPERIENCE REQUIRED, AWARD FOR A PERIOD
OF TWO YEARS, PERFORMANCE BOND AND 25K BOND
REQUIRED

NO. OF RESPONDENTS:

4

NAME OF BIDDER

ALL CLEAN BUILDING SERVICES INC.

CNS CLEANING CO,, INC.

ORIENTAL PACIFIC MAINTENANCE CO.

GOOD MORNING CARE BUILDING
MAINTENANCE, INC.

ADDRESS

990 SPRUCE STREET

501 CAMBRIA AVENUE, SUITE 131

ONE LETHBRIDGE PLAZA, SUITE #4

1254 GARRISON COURT

CITY, STATE, ZIP

LAWRENCEVILLE, NJ 08648

BENSALEM, PA 19020-7213

MAHWAH, NJ 07430

MAHWAH, NJ 07430

CONTACT FRED VALENTINO, SR. VP AUDREY R. SMITH JIN B. KIM JUN LEE
TELEPHONE 609 695 1010 856 488 8883 201 529 1616 917 319 6874

FAX 609 695 1022 856 488 5538 201 529 1616 201 870 6016

E-MAIL FREDDIE@ALLCELANINC.COM CNSCLEANINGCO@AOL.COM OPMCNJ@YAHOO.COM OODMORNINGCBMT@GMAIL.COM
HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS YES YES YES YES

CONTINUITY OF SERVICE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE WILL PROVIDE

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

EXHIBIT A

OK

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

OK

OK

EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1

OK

OK

OK

OK

EMPLOYEE INFORMATION CERTIFICATE

4691 EXPIRES 3.15.14

33470 EXPIRES 1.15.16

29022 EXPIRES 10.15.14

51166 EXPIRES 7.15.20

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

OK

OK

OK

OK

STOCK HOLDER DISCLOSURE

OK

OK

OK

OK

BID DEPOSIT AND CONSENT OF SURETY

AEGIS SECURITY INSURANCE COMPANY 10%
NTE 20K, FERNANDA L. DEPAOLANTONIO AIF
WITH POA

WESTERN SURETY COMPANY 10% NTE 20K,
JOHN F. BOLGER, JR. AIF WITH POA

COMPANION PROPERTY & CASUALTY
INSURANCE COMPANY 10%, PHILIP S. TOBEY
AIF WITH POA

WESTERN SURETY COMPANY 10% NTE 20K,
EILEEN CHVASTA AIF WITH POA

$25,000.00 DISHONESTY BOND REQUIRED FROM AWARDED
CONTRACTOR

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REQUIRED IF AWARDED

REFERENCES INCLUDED, PROS AND B&G TO REVIEW DID NOT PROVIDE INCLUDED, PROS AND B&G TO REVIEW INCLUDED, PROS AND B&G TO REVIEW
EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE
FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO




PROPOSAL FOR JANITORIAL SERVICES AT 1589 LAMBERTON STREET, TRENTON AND 1 JOHNSTON AVENUE, HAMILTON TOWNSHIP

PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE NDOA\ZF DAILY RATE TOTAL DAILY RATE TOTAL DAILY RATE TOTAL DAILY RATE TOTAL
YEAR ONE ALL CLEAN CNS ORIENTAL PACIFIC GOOD MORNING CARE
ONE DAY MATRON MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY 246 78.00 | $19,188.00 106.80 | $26,272.80 137.00 | $33,702.00 121.00 | $ 29,766.00
8:00 AM THROUGH 4:00 PM

YEAR TWO

ONE DAY MATRON MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY 246 78.00 | $19,188.00 106.80 | $26,272.80 137.00 | $33,702.00 121.00 | $ 29,766.00
8:00 AM THROUGH 4:00 PM

TOTAL $38,376.00 $52,545.60 $67,404.00 $ 59,532.00
HOURLY RATE FOR ADDITIONAL WORK NO BID NO BID 18.00 15.00
VOTING MACHINE WAREHOUSE

YEAR ONE

ONE CUSTODIAN ON TUESDAYS AND THURSDAYS? 104 34.00 [ $ 3,536.00 40.05 | $ 4,165.20 48.00 | $ 4,992.00 96.00 | $ 9,984.00
THREE HOURS DAILY

YEAR TWO

ONE CUSTODIAN ON TUESDAYS AND THURSDAYS* 104 34.00 [ $ 3,536.00 40.05 | $ 4,165.20 48.00 | $ 4,992.00 96.00 | $ 9,984.00
THREE HOURS DAILY

TOTAL $ 7,072.00 $ 8,330.40 $ 9,984.00 $ 19,968.00
HOURLY RATE FOR ADDITIONAL WORK NO BID NO BID $ 18.00 NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR TWO YEARS $45,448.00 $60,876.00 $77,388.00 $ 79,500.00

*OR AS DESIGNATED ON A HOLIDAY




BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2013-18 COLLISION REPAIRS AND VEHICLE PAINTING

October 10, 2013

COLLISION REPAIRS, BODYWORK, VEHICLE PAINTING, FRAME
REPAIR AND MECHANICAL REPAIRS DUE TO COLLISION

AWARD TO LOW BIDDER FOR EACH

DAMAGE; AWARD TWO CONTRACTS; FIVE YEARS CATEGORY AWARD C AWARD A & B
EXPERIENCE, AWARD TO LOW BIDDER PER CATEGORY
NO. OF RESPONDENTS: 5

NAME OF BIDDER

LUCKYS AUTO BODY

KISTHARDT BODY WORKS INC.

HAINESPORT ENTERPRISES, INC.

YOUNGS AUTO BODY, INC.

ED AND GUYS AUTO BODY

ADDRESS 1108 DIVISION STREET 1600 CHAMBERS STREET 1466 RT. 38, PO BOX 449 43 HOVEY AVENUE 1182 SO. OLDEN AVENUE
CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON, NJ 08611 TRENTON, NJ HAINESPORT, NJ 08036 HAMILTON, NJ 08610 HAMILTON, NJ 08610
CONTACT JOHN LUCKY JERRY LANE THOMAS C. AMENDOLA SAMMUEL J. VALLANGO JR. MARTIN CHELL
TELEPHONE 609 695 6979 609 599 4592 609 267 7392 609 586 3810 609 393 4080

FAX 609 695 6979 609 396 0816 609 267 3880 609 586 3221 609 393 4083
EMAIL LUCKYSAUTOBODY@AOL.COM KISTHARDTBODYWORKS @GMAIL.COM TOMAMENDOLA@HOTMAIL.COM YABINC@OPTONLINE.NET EDANDGUYS@AOL.COM

INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM AWARDED VENDOR

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES YES
EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
EXECUTIVE ORDER 98-1 OK OK OK OK OK

EMPLOYEE INFORMATION CERTIFICATE

31712 EXPIRES 12/15/15

REQUIRED IF AWARDED 11929 EXPIRES 8/15/16

21972 EXPIRES 10/15/17

19949 EXPIRES 10/15/16

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION

OK

OK OK

OK

OK

STOCK HOLDER DISCLOSURE

OK

OK OK

OK

OK

EMERGENCY WORK

YES

NO YES

NO

YES

HOLD PRICING BEYOND 60 DAYS

YES

YES YES

YES

YES

MOTOR VEHICLE AUTO BODY LICENSE

00700A EXPIRES 9/2014

00681A EXPIRES 9/2014 00267A EXPIRES 9/2014

01109A EXPIRES 9/2014

03577A EXPIRES 9/2014

HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE ENDORSEMENT FOR VEHICLES >
14,000 GVW

N/A

N/A 000012 EXPIRES 9/2014

N/A

N/A

REFERENCES, MOTOR POOL TO CHECK

INCLUDED

INCLUDED INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

OPTION A, AUTO, LIGHT TRUCK AND VAN REPAIRS TO 9,200
GVW

NO BID

PARTS DISCOUNT

5%

LIST, NO DISCOUNT

12%

LIST, NO DISCOUNT

BODY LABOR

30.00

40.00

30.00

29.00

PAINT LABOR

30.00

40.00

30.00

29.00

MECHANICAL LABOR

30.00

40.00

30.00

29.00

OPTION B, MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK AND BUS REPAIRS 9,201 TO
13,999 GVW

NO BID

NO BID

PARTS DISCOUNT

LIST, NO DISCOUNT

5%

LIST, NO DISCOUNT

BODY LABOR

48.00

48.00

30.00

PAINT LABOR

48.00

48.00

30.00

MECHANICAL LABOR

48.00

50.00

30.00

OPTION C HEAVY DUTY TRUCK AND BUS 14,000 GVW AND
OVER *REQUIRES HEAVY VEHICLE ENDORSEMENT

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

PARTS DISCOUNT

5%

BODY LABOR

65.00

PAINT LABOR

65.00

MECHANICAL LABOR

70.00

EXCEPTIONS

NONE; NO BID ON OPTIONB OR C

NONE; NO BID OPTION C NONE; NO BID OPTION A

NONE REFERENCED; NO BID OPTIONB OR C

NONE; NO BID OPTION C

FATAL FLAW

NO

NO NO

NO

NO




PROPOSAL FOR JANITORIAL SERVICES AT 1589 LAMBERTON STREET, TRENTON AND 1 JOHNSTON AVENUE, HAMILTON TOWNSHIP

PROSECUTOR'S OFFICE NDOA\ZF DAILY RATE TOTAL DAILY RATE TOTAL DAILY RATE TOTAL DAILY RATE TOTAL
YEAR ONE ALL CLEAN CNS ORIENTAL PACIFIC GOOD MORNING CARE
ONE DAY MATRON MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY 246 78.00 | $19,188.00 106.80 | $26,272.80 137.00 | $33,702.00 121.00 | $ 29,766.00
8:00 AM THROUGH 4:00 PM

YEAR TWO

ONE DAY MATRON MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY 246 78.00 | $19,188.00 106.80 | $26,272.80 137.00 | $33,702.00 121.00 | $ 29,766.00
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HOURLY RATE FOR ADDITIONAL WORK NO BID NO BID 18.00 15.00
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YEAR ONE

ONE CUSTODIAN ON TUESDAYS AND THURSDAYS? 104 34.00 [ $ 3,536.00 40.05 | $ 4,165.20 48.00 | $ 4,992.00 96.00 | $ 9,984.00
THREE HOURS DAILY

YEAR TWO

ONE CUSTODIAN ON TUESDAYS AND THURSDAYS* 104 34.00 [ $ 3,536.00 40.05 | $ 4,165.20 48.00 | $ 4,992.00 96.00 | $ 9,984.00
THREE HOURS DAILY

TOTAL $ 7,072.00 $ 8,330.40 $ 9,984.00 $ 19,968.00
HOURLY RATE FOR ADDITIONAL WORK NO BID NO BID $ 18.00 NO BID
GRAND TOTAL FOR TWO YEARS $45,448.00 $60,876.00 $77,388.00 $ 79,500.00
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BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2013-18 COLLISION REPAIRS AND VEHICLE PAINTING

October 10, 2013

COLLISION REPAIRS, BODYWORK, VEHICLE PAINTING, FRAME
REPAIR AND MECHANICAL REPAIRS DUE TO COLLISION
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DAMAGE; AWARD TWO CONTRACTS; FIVE YEARS CATEGORY AWARD C AWARD A & B
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ED AND GUYS AUTO BODY
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OK OK
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YES
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MOTOR VEHICLE AUTO BODY LICENSE

00700A EXPIRES 9/2014

00681A EXPIRES 9/2014 00267A EXPIRES 9/2014

01109A EXPIRES 9/2014

03577A EXPIRES 9/2014
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N/A
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REFERENCES, MOTOR POOL TO CHECK

INCLUDED

INCLUDED INCLUDED

INCLUDED
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OPTION A, AUTO, LIGHT TRUCK AND VAN REPAIRS TO 9,200
GVW

NO BID

PARTS DISCOUNT

5%

LIST, NO DISCOUNT

12%

LIST, NO DISCOUNT

BODY LABOR

30.00

40.00

30.00

29.00

PAINT LABOR

30.00

40.00

30.00

29.00
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30.00

40.00

30.00

29.00

OPTION B, MEDIUM DUTY TRUCK AND BUS REPAIRS 9,201 TO
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NO BID
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PARTS DISCOUNT

LIST, NO DISCOUNT
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LIST, NO DISCOUNT

BODY LABOR
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48.00

30.00
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FATAL FLAW

NO

NO NO
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