53 N.J.R. 47(a)

VOLUME 53, ISSUE 1, JANUARY 4, 2021
RULE ADOPTIONS

Reporter
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

NJ - New Jersey Register > 2021 > JANUARY > JANUARY 4, 2021 > RULE ADOPTIONS >
COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Agency

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Administrative Code Citation

Adopted Amendments: N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14, 3.16, 3.21, and 3.22

Text

DIVISION OF CODES AND STANDARDS
Uniform Construction Code
Proposed: March 2, 2020, at 52 N.J.R. 385(a).

Adopted: June 30, 2020, by Lt. Governor Sheila Y. Oliver, Commissioner, Department of Community Affairs.

Filed: December 9, 2020, as R.2021 d.004, with non-substantial changes not requiring additional public notice
and comment (see N.J.A.C. 1:30-6.3).

Authority: N.J.S.A. 52:27D-124.

Effective Date: January 4, 2021.
Expiration Date: March 25, 2022.
Summary of Public Comments and Agency Responses:

Comments were received from Mitchell Malec, a former employee of the Department of Community Affairs
(Department).

1. COMMENT: The commenter expressed support for the Department's various "housekeeping efforts."”

RESPONSE: The Department thanks the commenter for his support.


https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61KF-6SJ1-DY33-B087-00000-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20FM-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20G2-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20FF-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20HV-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:5XKV-PWB1-JW5H-X0F4-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=statutes-legislation&id=urn:contentItem:5HHV-6D61-DXC8-00ND-00000-00&context=

Page 2 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

2. COMMENT: The commenter rescinded a correction he had recommended to the Department via email in June
2019. The commenter recommended that the Department review and correct, if needed, the following: N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.21(c)4v and (c)4vii. A review of N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.21(c)3ii(2) was also recommended, as this item references
Bulletin 03-4, which has since been superseded by Bulletin 19-1.

RESPONSE: The Department thanks the commenter for his suggestions. The citations at N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.21(c)4v
and (c)4vii and the incorrect Bulletin referenced at N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.21(c)3ii(2), previously discussed in the notice of
proposal Summary at item 27, will be remedied upon adoption.

3. COMMENT: The commenter recommended revisions to the Department's notice of administrative correction
regarding the Rehabilitation Subcode, Change of Use, N.J.A.C. 5:23-6.31()).

RESPONSE: Notices of administrative correction are outside the scope of this rulemaking and, therefore, cannot
be incorporated.

4. COMMENT: The commenter stated that he anticipates that the Department will be able to address all editorial
"letter" citation corrections of the One- and Two-Family Dwelling Subcode within the next decade, with the caveat
that the Department will not continue to adopt citations of the subcode requiring and lacking a letter qualifier.

RESPONSE: The letter citations within the One- and Two-Family Dwelling Subcode aid users in the "subject" of
the portion of the code it refers to. The Department engages in continual revisions to these items as they are
noticed because they are an aid to users, but believes the section of the code is clear even without the letter
designator.

Federal Standards Statement

No Federal standards analysis is required because the amendments are not being adopted in order to implement,
comply with, or participate in any program established under Federal law or under a State law that incorporates or
refers to Federal law, standards, or requirements.

Full text of the adoption follows (additions to the proposal indicated in boldface with asterisks *thus*; deletions
from proposal indicated in brackets with asterisks *[thus]*):

SUBCHAPTER 3. SUBCODES

5:23-3.14 Building subcode

(a) (No change.)

(b) The following chapters of the building subcode are modified as follows:
1. (No change.)

2. Chapter 2, Definitions, shall be amended as follows:

i.-xi. (No change.)

xii. The definition of "evacuation, slow" shall be inserted as follows:

"EVACUATION, SLOW. The movement of all occupants, residents and staff to an exit in more than 3
minutes, but not more than 13 minutes."

xiii.-xxxv. (No change.)
3. Chapter 3, Use and Occupancy Classification, shall be amended as follows:

i.-X. (No change.)


https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20FF-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20FF-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20FF-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20FF-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20FF-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:5XKV-PWB1-JJK6-S21S-00009-00&context=

Page 3 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

xi. In Section 310.4, Residential Group R-3, in the second and third line "in nature" shall be deleted. Additionally, in
the list of occupancies, Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants, shall be deleted and
Boarding houses (non-transient) shall be amended by deleting "(non-transient),” and by inserting "with 5 or fewer
occupants”. The terms "Convents," "Dormitories," "Fraternities and Sororities,” "Monasteries," "Congregate living
facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants,” "Boarding Houses (transient)," and "Lodging houses with five or
fewer guest rooms and 10 or fewer occupants” shall be deleted. The terms "Alcohol and drug treatment houses with
5 or fewer residents," "Detached one- and two-family dwellings greater than three stories in height, multiple single-
family townhouses greater than three stories in height, attached two-family dwellings separated from adjacent units
by firewalls, and other one- and two-family dwellings that are outside the scope of the one- and two-family dwelling
subcode," "Group homes with five or fewer occupants in accordance with Section 308.2.4," "Rooming houses with
five or fewer occupants,” and "Single residential occupancies, accessory to a dwelling unit, having no more than
five roomers or lodgers. (Single occupancies, accessory to a dwelling unit, having more than five roomers or
lodgers shall be classified as Group R-2 or I-1, as appropriate.)" shall be inserted.

xii.-xiii. (No change.)

xiv. New Section 310.6, Residential Group R-5, shall be inserted as follows: "Residential Group R-5 occupancies
shall include all detached one- and two-family dwellings not more than three stories in height with a separate means
of egress and multiple single-family townhouses not more than three stories in height with a separate means of
egress designed and constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code. This Group shall also
include:

Care facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons receiving care;

Single residential occupancies, accessory to a dwelling unit, having no more than five roomers or lodgers. (Single
occupancies, accessory to a dwelling unit, having more than five roomers or lodgers shall be classified as Group R-
2 or I-1, as appropriate.);

Group Homes with 5 or fewer occupants in accordance with Section 308.2.4;
Rooming houses with five or fewer residents;

Cooperative sober living residences with not more than 10 occupants, excluding staff; each occupant, including
staff, shall be capable of prompt evacuation.”

4. Chapter 4, Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy, shall be amended as follows:
i.-viii. (No change.)

ix. In Section 420, "I-2 Assisted Living," shall be inserted in the title. Additionally, in Section 420.7, Group I-1
Assisted living housing units, in the title and in the first line, change "I-1" to "I-2"; delete Item #4; and in Item #5,
change "Group I-1, Condition 2" to "Group I-2, Condition 1".

x.-Xi. (No change.)

5. Chapter 5, General Building Heights and Areas, shall be amended as follows:

i. Section 502.1, Address identification, shall be deleted in its entirety.

ii.-iv. (No change.)

v. Table 506.2, ALLOWABLE AREA FACTOR IN SQUARE FEET, shall be amended as follows:
(1)-(2) (No change.)

[page=48] (3) Under construction Type VB for Group H-2, S1, and SM, "3,000" shall be deleted and "NP" shall be
inserted.



Page 4 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

(4)-(5) (No change.)

vi.-viii. (No change.)

6. (No change.)

7. Chapter 7, Fire and Smoke Protection Features, shall be amended as follows:
i.-ix. (No change.)

X. In Section 716.1.1, Alternative methods for determining fire protection ratings, exception 4, "Section 104.11"
shall be deleted and "the administrative provisions of the Uniform Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be
inserted.

8. Chapter 9, Fire Protection Systems, shall be amended as follows:
i.-iv. (No change.)

v. Section 903.2.1.2., Group A-2, shall be amended to add a new section 903.2.1.2.1 as follows: "903.2.1.2.1 In
Group A-2 Nightclubs, the automatic sprinkler system shall be tied to the performance sound system and to the
house lights in such a way that activation of the automatic sprinkler system mutes the performance sound system
and restores the intensity of illumination to that required by Section 1008.2."

vi.-vii. (No change.)

viii. New Section 903.2.13, Automatic sprinkler system thresholds, shall be inserted as follows: "An automatic
sprinkler system shall be required in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 when the maximum area is exceeded for
the following construction types of Groups B, F-2, and S-2 in accordance with Table 903.2.13, Automatic Sprinkler
System Thresholds. All others not listed shall follow the applicable requirements as set forth in the IBC/2018.

(No change in Table 903.2.13.)
ix.-xxix. (No change.)

xxX. Insert Section 905.4.3 from Section 915.7.1 of the 1996 BOCA National Building Code as follows "905.4.3
Location: At each floor level and not more than 5 feet (1,524 mm) above the floor, there shall be connected to each
standpipe a 2 1/2-inch hose connection with valves and threads compatible with the connections used by the local
fire department.”

xxxi.-xxxvi. (No change.)
xxxvii. (No change in text.)

xxxviii. Add new section 907.2.1.2 as follows: "907.2.1.2 Group A-2 Nightclubs. An automatic fire detection system
shall be installed throughout all Group A-2 nightclubs with an occupant load of 100 or more. If the alarm is activated
by smoke detectors, it shall be activated by either two cross-zoned smoke detectors within a single protected area
or a single smoke detector monitored by an alarm verification zone or an approved equivalent method and the
smoke detectors shall be of a type designed to reduce the possibility of false notifications based on the conditions
present in the area protected. The automatic fire detection system shall be tied to the performance sound system
and to the house lights in such a way that activation of the fire detection system mutes the performance sound
system and restores the intensity of illumination to that required by Section 1008.2.

Exception: Automatic fire detection systems are not required in buildings provided with an automatic sprinkler
system throughout."

Recodify existing xl.-xliv. as xxxix.-xliii. (No change in text.)


https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:60PG-FNF1-F06F-21X3-00009-00&context=

Page 5 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

xliv. A new Section 907.2.9A, Automatic smoke detection systems for Group R-4, shall be added to include
Section 907.2.10.2, Automatic smoke detection system, of the IBC/2015:

907.2.9A, Automatic smoke detection systems for Group R-4. An automatic smoke detection system that activates
the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in corridors, waiting areas
opento corridors and habitable spaces other than sleeping units and kitchens.

Exceptions:

1. Smoke detection in  habitable spaces is not required where the facility is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

2. An automatic smoke detection system is not required in buildings that do not have interior corridors serving
sleeping units and where each sleeping unit has a means of egress door opening directly to an exit or to an
exterior exit access that leads directly to an exit.

xlv.-Ixvi. (No change.)

Ixvii. Section 912.2, Location, shall be renumbered as 912.3 and "fire protection subcode official in coordination
with the" shall be inserted before "fire code official” in the last sentence.

Ixviii. Section 912.2.1, Visible location, shall be renumbered 912.3.1 and "or as otherwise approved by the fire
code official" shall be deleted.

Ixix. (No change.)

Ixx. New Section 912.4, Height, shall be inserted as follows:
"912.4, Height. Fire department connections shall not be less than 18 inches (457 mm) and more than 42
inches (1,067 mm) in elevation, measured from the ground level to the centerline of the inlets."

Ixxi.-Ixxxii. (No change.)

Ixxxiii. In Subsections 915.1.2 through 915.1.5, including the exceptions, the word "and" shall be deleted before
"classrooms" and the words "or any other occupiable space(s)" shall be added following "classrooms." In addition,
for subsection 915.1.4, exceptions 1 and 2.1, and subsection 915.1.5, exceptions 1 and 4, the word "or" shall be
deleted before "classrooms" and the words "or any other occupiable space(s)" shall be added following
"classrooms."”

Ixxxiv.-Ixxxvi. (No change.)
9. Chapter 10, Means of Egress, shall be amended as follows:
i.-vi. (No change.)

vii. In Table 1006.2.1, Spaces with one exit or exit access doorway, in the 5th column of the 10th row (R-3), the
reference to footnote a and g shall be deleted; and in footnote g, "R-3 and" shall be deleted. Additionally, in the
heading over the 3rd, 4th, and 5th row, "Common Path of Egress” shall be deleted and "Exit Access" shall be
inserted.

viii.-ix. (No change.)

X. In Table 1006.3.3(2), Stories with One Exit or Access to One Exit from Other Occupancies, under the heading
"Occupancy,” "U" shall be deleted from the first row. Additionally, in the heading of the fourth column, "common
path of travel" shall be deleted and "exit access" shall be inserted.

xi.-xvi. (No change.)



Page 6 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

xvii. In Section 1010.1.4.5, Security grilles, "In Groups B, F, M, and S" shall be deleted and "horizontal" shall be
capitalized.

xviii.-xx. (No change.)

xxi. Section 1010.1.9.4, Locks and latches, shall be amended as follows: In Item 2, following "Group A," insert
"other than nightclubs". In the same item, "and in" shall be inserted before the word "Groups" and "and in places of
religious worship” shall be deleted. In the same section, Item 7 shall be inserted as follows: "7. Key operation shall
be permitted from a dwelling unit provided that the key cannot be removed from the lock when the door is locked
from the side from which egress is made."

xxii. In Section 1010.1.10, Panic and fire exit hardware, in exception 1, "other than nightclubs" shall be inserted
after "Group A occupancies." Additionally, in the second paragraph, "1,200" shall be deleted and "800" shall be
inserted.

xxiii.-xxxv. (No change.)
10. Chapter 11, Accessibility, shall be amended as follows:
i.-v. (No change.)

vi. Section 1104.1, Site arrival points, in the exception, "Other than in buildings or facilities containing or serving
Type B units,” shall be deleted and "an" shall be capitalized.

vii. (No change in text.)

viii. In Section 1104.5, Location, exception 1 shall be deleted. In addition, in exception 2, "or Type B unit" shall be
deleted and "or" shall be inserted between "Accessible unit" and "Type A unit."

ix. (No change in text.)

X. Section 1105.1.7, Dwelling units and sleeping units, in the exception, "or Type B unit" shall be deleted and "or"
shall be inserted between "Accessible unit" and "Type A unit."

Xi. In Section 1106.2, Groups I-1, R-1, R-2, R-3, and R-4, in item 1, "or Type B unit" shall be deleted and "or" shall
be inserted between "Accessible unit" and "Type A unit." Additionally, insert the following at the end of item number
1: "Where additional parking spaces or parking lots are provided for visitors, the number of required accessible
parking spaces shall comply with the Table 1106.1." Lastly, item number 3 shall be deleted.

Recodify existing ix.-xi. as xii.-xiv. (No change in text.)

[page=49] xv. In Section 1107.3, Accessible spaces, "or Type B units" shall be deleted from the first sentence and
"or" shall be inserted between "Accessible units" and "Type A units." After "dining areas," the second sentence,
"laundry areas, mailboxes and meeting rooms" shall be inserted. The text of Exception #1 shall be deleted and the
following shall be inserted in its place: "Mailboxes shall be mounted at minimum height of 28 inches and a
maximum of 54 inches where a parallel approach is provided." Finally, Exception #3 shall be deleted in its entirety.

Recodify existing xiii.-xvii. xvi.-xx. (No change in text.)

xxi. Section 1107.5.2.2, Type B Units, shall be deleted and in its place insert the following:

"1107.5.2.2 Toilets used by residents. Toilets used by residents shall be provided sufficient clearance on
both sides of the toilet to enable the physical access and maneuvering by staff members to assist the
resident in wheelchair-to-toilet transfers and returns. Alternative grab bar configurations shall be permitted."

Recodify existing xix.-xx. as xxii.-xxiii. (No change in text.)



Page 7 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

xxiv. Section 1107.5.5, Group I-3, shall be renumbered as Section 1107.5.6 and the following shall be inserted in
its place:

1107.5.5 Assisted living facilities. Assisted living facilities that are licensed by the Department of Health are Group
I-2 for compliance with the building subcode, fire protection subcode, and the other subcodes of the Uniform
Construction Code and shall be Group R-2 for the purposes of accessibility.

1107.5.5.1. Dwelling units that are available for occupancy only for 30 or more consecutive days shall be required
to comply with Section 1003 of ICC/ANSI A117.1.

1107.5.5.2. Where an assisted living facility includes dwelling units or rooms that are available for occupancy for
fewer than 30 consecutive days, 50 percent of those dwelling units or rooms shall be accessible in compliance with
Section 1002 of ICC/ANSI A117.1 and shall include one full bathroom that complies with Section 1002 of ICC/ANSI
A117.1 and, where a kitchen is provided, it shall comply with Section 1002 of ICC/ANSI A117.1.

1107.5.5.3. In dwelling units in an assisted living facility that are designated Group R-2 for the purposes of
accessibility, the following may be adaptable:

1107.5.5.3.1. The threshold for an accessible transfer shower may be adaptable as long as the shower threshold
can be adapted with minimal expense and effort to be accessible; and

1107.5.5.3.2. A transfer-type shower of 36 inches by 48 inches that includes an accessible seat may be provided
in individual dwelling units. The threshold of this shower shall not exceed four inches.

Recodify existing xxii.-xxiv. as xxv.-xxvii. (No change in text.)

xxviii. In Section 1107.6.2, Group R-2, "and Type B units" shall be deleted and "and" shall be inserted between
"Accessible units" and "Type A units."

Recodify existing xxvi.-xxxiv. as xxix.-xxxvii. (No change in text.)

xxxviii. Insert new section 1107.6.5 as follows: "1107.6.5 COAH Units. The exemption for townhouses and
multistory units notwithstanding, multistory or multifloor townhouses for which credit is sought for low or moderate
income housing through the Council on Affordable Housing (COAH) shall have the following features, which shall
comply with the standards for Type A dwelling units per ICC/ANSI A117.1:

(1) An adaptable entrance, with the plans for the adaptation to provide an accessible entrance.
(A) (No change in text.)

Recodify existing ii.-iii. as (2)-(3) (No change in text.)

(4) An accessible interior route of travel.

(A) (No change in text.)

(5) (No change in text.)

Recodify existing xxxvi.-xxxvii. as xxxix.-xl. (No change in text.)

xli. Section 1107.7.2, Multistory units, shall be renumbered as Section 1107.7.1. The first sentence of this section
shall be deleted and replaced with the following: A multistory dwelling unit or sleeping unit that is not provided with
elevator service is required to be accessible as follows: The primary entrance to the unit shall comply with the
requirements for a Type A unit and, where provided within the unit, a living area, kitchen, and toilet and bathing
facility that comply with Type A dwelling unit shall be provided on that floor. In the seventh line, "Type B dwelling
unit" shall be deleted and "Type A unit" inserted in its place. Additionally, in the seventh line, following the word
"toilet,” "and bathing" shall be inserted.



Page 8 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

Recodify existing xxxix.-xli. as xlii.-xliv. (No change in text.)

xlv. Section 1109.1, General, in the exception, "and Type B unit" shall be deleted and "and" shall be inserted
between "Accessible unit" and "Type A unit."

Recodify existing xlii.-l. as xlvi.-liv. (No change in text.)

Iv. In Section 1110.4.14, Swimming pools, wading pools, hot tubs, and spas, Exception 3 shall be deleted in its
entirety.

Recodify existing lii.-liv. as Ivi.-lviii. (No change in text.)

11.-14. (No change.)

15. Chapter 16, Structural Design, shall be amended as follows:
i.-ii. (No change.)

iii. In Section 1607.7.5, Posting, "Section 106.1" shall be deleted and "the administrative provisions of the Uniform
Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be inserted.

Recodify existing iii.-vi. as iv.-vii. (No change in text.)

viii. In Section 1612.4, Flood hazard documentation, items 1.1 and 2.1, "Section 110.3.3" and "Section 110.3.11.1"
shall be deleted and "the administrative provisions of the Uniform Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be
inserted in all instances.

16. Chapter 17, Structural Tests and Special Inspections, shall be amended as follows:
i.-ix. (No change.)

X. In Section 1704.2, Special inspections and tests, in the first sentence, "of Class 1 buildings only or any building
containing a smoke control system" shall be inserted after "construction." Additionally, in exceptions #1 and #2,
"building official" shall be deleted and "construction official* shall be inserted. Lastly, "Section 105" and "Section
110" shall be deleted and "the administrative provisions of the Uniform Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be
inserted in both locations.

xi.-xx. (No change.)

xXi. In Section 1705.12.1.2, Structural steel elements, "B and C," shall be deleted in reference to seismic design
categories. In addition, exception 1 shall be deleted.

xXii.-xxiv. (No change.)

xxv. In Section 1705.12.6, Plumbing, Mechanical and Electrical Components, in items 1, 3, 4, 5, and 6, "C," shall
be deleted in reference to seismic design categories.

xxvi.-xxx. (No change.)
17. Chapter 18, Soils and Foundations, shall be amended as follows:
i.-ix. (No change.)

X. In Section 1810.3.10.4, Seismic reinforcement, "Section 104.11" shall be deleted and "the administrative
provisions of the Uniform Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be inserted.

xi. (No change in text.)


https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:60PG-FNF1-F06F-21X3-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:60PG-FNF1-F06F-21X3-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:60PG-FNF1-F06F-21X3-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:60PG-FNF1-F06F-21X3-00009-00&context=

Page 9 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

18. Chapter 23, Wood, shall be amended as follows:
i.-ii. (No change.)

iii. In Section 2303.4.6, TPI 1 specifications, "Section 104" shall be deleted and "the administrative provisions of
the Uniform Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be inserted.

Recodify existing iii.-v. as iv.-vi. (No change in text.)
19. Chapter 25, Gypsum Board, Gypsum Panel Products and Plaster, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 2503.1, Inspection, "Section 110.3.5" shall be deleted and "the administrative provisions of the
Uniform Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be inserted.

Recodify existing 19.-20. as 20.-21. (No change in text.)
22. Chapter 30, Elevators and Conveyor Systems, shall be amended as follows:
i.-xv. (No change.)

xvi. In Section 3008.6.6, Two-way communication system, in the first sentence, "or an alternate location approved
by the fire department and" shall be deleted.

23. Chapter 31, Special Construction, shall be amended as follows:
i.-ii. (No change.)

iv. Section 3109, Swimming Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices, shall be deleted in its entirety and the following
shall be inserted:

SECTION 3109 SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS

[page=50] 3109.1 General. The design and construction of pools, spas, hot tubs and enclosures shall comply with
the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code listed in Chapter 35.

3109.2 Amendments to the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code. The following amendments shall be made
to the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code:

1.-2. (No change.)

3. Chapter 3, General Compliance, shall be amended as follows:
3.1-3.8 (No change.)

3.9 (No change in text.)

3.10 (No change in text.)

4.-5. (No change.)

v.-vi. (No change.)

Recodify existing 23.-26. as 24.-27. (No change in text.)
5:23-3.16 Electrical subcode

(a) Rules concerning the electrical subcode adopted are as follows:


https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:60PG-FNF1-F06F-21X3-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:60PG-FNF1-F06F-21X3-00009-00&context=

Page 10 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

1. (No change.)
2. The National Electrical Code 2017 may be known and cited as "the electrical subcode."

i. Codes and standards referenced in the Informational Notes of the electrical subcode (NEC 2017) shall be
considered adopted by reference to the extent prescribed by each related section. These codes and standards also
are printed in DCA Bulletin # 19-3, which contains a list of adopted codes and standards that are applicable to the
enforcement of the electrical subcode.

3. (No change.)

(b) The following chapters or articles of the electrical subcode are amended as follows:
1.-6. (No change.)

7. Chapter 6 of the electrical subcode, entitled "Special Equipment," is amended as follows:
i.-iv. (No change.)

v. In Section 620.91, Emergency and Standby Power Systems, the Informational Note shall have "Al17.1-
2013/CSA B44-13" deleted and "ASME A17.1-2016/CSA B44-16" shall be inserted in its place; and

vi. (No change.)

8.-9. (No change.)

5:23-3.21 One- and two-family dwelling subcode

(a)-(b) (No change.)

(c) The following chapters or sections of the IRC/2018 shall be modified as follows:

1.-2. (No change.)

3. Chapter 3, Building Planning, shall be amended as follows:

i. (No change.)

ii. Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria, shall be amended as follows:
1. Under the heading of "Ground Snow Load," insert "see Bulletin 19-1";

2. Under the heading of "Wind Design--Speed," insert "see Bulletin *[03-4]* *19-1*";

3.-7. (No change.)

8. Under the heading of "Subject to damage from - Frost line depth," insert "2'6" SNJ; 3'0" NNJ";
9.-17. (No change.)

iii.-xxii. (No change.)

Recodify existing xxiv.-xxv. as xxiii.-xxiv. (No change in text.)

xxv. In Section R311.8.3.1, Height, "34 inches (864 mm)" shall be deleted and "30 inches (762 mm)" shall be
inserted.

xxvi.-xliii. (No change.)



Page 11 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

xliv. In Section R326.1, General, "and enclosures" shall be inserted between "spas" and "shall." In addition, the
following shall be added to the end of the section: "Amendments to the ISPC shall be as follows:

1.-2. (No change.)

3. Chapter 3, General Compliance, shall be amended as follows:
3.1-3.8 (No change.)

3.9 (No change in text.)

3.10 (No change in text.)

4.-5. (No change.)

4. Chapter 4, Foundations, shall be amended as follows:

i.-iv. (No change.)

v. In Section *R* 404.2.5, Drainage and dampproofing, delete "Sections R405 and R406, respectively." and insert
"Section R406."

vi. (No change.)

vii. In Section *R* 404.4, Retaining walls, in the first sentence, "that are not laterally supported at the top and that
retain in excess of 48 inches (1219 mm) of unbalanced fill, or retaining walls exceeding 24 inches (610 mm) in
height that resist lateral loads in addition to soil" shall be deleted and "for which a construction permit is required by
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.14" shall be inserted.

5.-11. (No change.)
12. Chapter 13, General Mechanical System Requirements, shall be amended as follows:
i.-ii. (No change.)

iv. In Section M1307.5, Electrical appliances, "and 34 through 43" shall be deleted and "and the electrical subcode
(N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.16)" shall be inserted at the end of the sentence.

v.-vi. (No change.)

13.-24. (No change.)
5:23-3.22 Fuel gas subcode
(a) (No change.)

(b) The following chapters, sections or pages of the International Fuel Gas Code/2018 shall be amended as
follows:

1.-3. (No change.)
4. Chapter 4 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Gas Piping Installation," shall be amended as follows:
i.-ii. (No change.)

iii. In Section 402.7.1, Operation below -5#[degrees]#F (-21#[degrees]#C), insert the following at the beginning of
the section: "The operating pressure for undiluted LP-gas systems shall not exceed 20 psig (140 kPa gauge).”


https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:6182-YCS1-DYV0-G0YX-00009-00&context=
https://advance.lexis.com/api/document?collection=administrative-codes&id=urn:contentItem:61MR-S0F1-JWXF-20G2-00009-00&context=

Page 12 of 12
53 N.J.R. 47(a)

iv. (No change.)

5.-9. (No change.)

NEW JERSEY REGISTER
Copyright © 2021 by the New Jersey Office of Administrative Law

End of Document



	53 N.J.R. 47(a)
	Text


