CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS

User notes:

About this chapter: Codes, by their very nature, are technical documents. Every word, term and punctuation mark can add to or change the
meaning of a technical requirement. It is necessary to maintain a consensus on the specific meaning of each term contained in the code.
Chapter 2 performs this function by stating clearly what specific terms mean for the purpose of the code.

Code development reminder: Code change proposals to sections preceded by the designation [A] or [BS] will be considered by one of the
code development committees meeting during the 2019 (Group B) Code Development Cycle. See explanation on page iv.

SECTION 201
GENERAL

201.1 Scope. Unless otherwise expressly stated, the follow-
ing words and terms shall, for the purposes of this code, have
the meanings shown in this chapter.

201.2 Interchangeability. Words used in the present tense
include the future; words stated in the masculine gender
include the feminine and neuter; the singular number includes
the plural and the plural, the singular.

201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not
defined in this code and are defined in the International
Energy Conservation Code, International Fuel Gas Code,
International Fire Code, International Mechanical Code or
International Plumbing Code, such terms shall have the
meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.

201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined
through the methods authorized by this section, such terms
shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the context
implies.

SECTION 202
DEFINITIONS

[BG] 24-HOUR BASIS. The actual time that a person is an
occupant within a facility for the purpose of receiving care. It
shall not include a facility that is open for 24 hours and is
capable of providing care to someone visiting the facility
during any segment of the 24 hours.

[BS] AAC MASONRY. Masonry made of autoclaved aer-
ated concrete (AAC) units, manufactured without internal
reinforcement and bonded together using thin- or thick-bed
mortar.

[BE] ACCESSIBLE. A site, building, facility or portion
thereof that complies with Chapter 11.

[BE] ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS. A continuous
and unobstructed way of egress travel from any accessible
point in a building or facility to a public way.

[BE] ACCESSIBLE ROUTE. A continuous, unobstructed
path that complies with Chapter 11.

[BE] ACCESSIBLE UNIT. A dwelling unit or sleeping unit
that complies with this code and the provisions for Accessible
units in ICC A117.1.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

[BS] ACCREDITATION BODY. An approved, third-party
organization that is independent of the grading and inspection
agencies, and the lumber mills, and that initially accredits and
subsequently monitors, on a continuing basis, the compe-
tency and performance of a grading or inspection agency
related to carrying out specific tasks.

[BS] ADHERED MASONRY VENEER. Veneer secured
and supported through the adhesion of an approved bonding
material applied to an approved backing.

[BS] ADOBE CONSTRUCTION. Construction in which
the exterior load-bearing and nonload-bearing walls and par-
titions are of unfired clay masonry units, and floors, roofs and
interior framing are wholly or partly of wood or other
approved materials.

Adobe, stabilized. Unfired clay masonry units to which
admixtures, such as emulsified asphalt, are added during
the manufacturing process to limit the units’ water absorp-
tion so as to increase their durability.

Adobe, unstabilized. Unfired clay masonry units that do
not meet the definition of “Adobe, stabilized.”

[F] AEROSOL CONTAINER. A metal can or plastic con-
tainer up to a maximum size of 33.8 fluid ounces (1000 ml),
or a glass bottle up to a maximum size of 4 fluid ounces (118
ml), designed and intended to dispense an aerosol.

[F] AEROSOL PRODUCT. A combination of a container, a
propellant and a material that is dispensed. Aerosol products
shall be classified by means of the calculation of their chemi-
cal heats of combustion and shall be designated Level 1,
Level 2 or Level 3.

Level 1 aerosol products. Those with a total chemical
heat of combustion that is less than or equal to 8,600 Brit-
ish thermal units per pound (Btu/lb) (20 kJ/g).

Level 2 aerosol products. Those with a total chemical
heat of combustion that is greater than 8,600 Btu/Ib (20 kJ/
g), but less than or equal to 13,000 Btu/Ib (30 kJ/g).

Level 3 aerosol products. Those with a total chemical
heat of combustion that is greater than 13,000 Btu/Ib (30
kJ/g).
[BS] AGGREGATE. In roofing, crushed stone, crushed slag
or water-worn gravel used for surfacing for roof coverings.
[BG] AGRICULTURAL BUILDING. A structure designed
and constructed to house farm implements, hay, grain, poul-
try, livestock or other horticultural products. This structure

3




DEFINITIONS

shall not be a place of human habitation or a place of employ-
ment where agricultural products are processed, treated or
packaged, nor shall it be a place used by the public. A struc-
ture qualifying under the Uniform Construction Code defini-
tion of a Commercial Farm Building may be built according
to the regulations at N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.2(d).

[BF] AIR-IMPERMEABLE INSULATION. An insulation
having an air permeance equal to or less than 0.02 1/s x m? at
75 pa pressure differential tested in accordance with ASTM
E2178 or ASTM E283.

[BG] AIR-INFLATED STRUCTURE. A structure that
uses air-pressurized membrane beams, arches or other ele-
ments to enclose space. Occupants of such a structure do not
occupy the pressurized area used to support the structure.

[BG] AIR-SUPPORTED STRUCTURE. A structure
wherein the shape of the structure is attained by air pressure
and occupants of the structure are within the elevated pres-
sure area. Air-supported structures are of two basic types:

Double skin. Similar to a single skin, but with an attached
liner that is separated from the outer skin and provides an
airspace which serves for insulation, acoustic, aesthetic or
similar purposes.

Single skin. Where there is only the single outer skin and
the air pressure is directly against that skin.

[BE] AISLE. An unenclosed exit access component that
defines and provides a path of egress travel.

[BE] AISLE ACCESSWAY. That portion of an exit access
that leads to an aisle.

[F] ALARM NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE. A fire alarm
system component such as a bell, horn, speaker, light or text
display that provides audible, tactile or visible outputs, or any
combination thereof.

[F] ALARM SIGNAL. A signal indicating an emergency
requiring immediate action, such as a signal indicative of fire.

[F] ALARM VERIFICATION FEATURE. A feature of
automatic fire detection and alarm systems to reduce
unwanted alarms wherein smoke detectors report alarm con-
ditions for a minimum period of time, or confirm alarm con-
ditions within a given time period, after being automatically
reset, in order to be accepted as a valid alarm-initiation sig-
nal.

[BS] ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN. A method of pro-
portioning structural members, such that elastically computed
stresses produced in the members by nominal loads do not
exceed specified allowable stresses (also called “working
stress design”).

[BE] ALTERNATING TREAD DEVICE. A device that
has a series of steps between 50 and 70 degrees (0.87 and
1.22 rad) from horizontal, usually attached to a center support
rail in an alternating manner so that the user does not have
both feet on the same level at the same time.

[BG] AMBULATORY CARE FACILITY. Buildings or
portions thereof used to provide medical, surgical, psychiat-
ric, nursing or similar care on a less than 24-hour basis to
persons where evacuation is impractical.

[BG] ANCHOR BUILDING. An exterior perimeter build-
ing of a group other than H having direct access to a covered

or open mall building but having required means of egress
independent of the mall.

[BS] ANCHORED MASONRY VENEER. Veneer secured
with approved mechanical fasteners to an approved backing.

[BF] ANNULAR SPACE. The opening around the pene-
trating item.

[F] ANNUNCIATOR. A unit containing one or more indica-
tor lamps, alphanumeric displays or other equivalent means
in which each indication provides status information about a
circuit, condition or location.

[A] APPROVED. Acceptable to the building official or other
appropriate subcode official.

[A] APPROVED AGENCY. An established and recognized
agency that is regularly engaged in conducting tests, furnish-

ing inspection services or furnishing product certification
where such agency has been approved by the building offi-
cial.

[BS] APPROVED FABRICATOR. An established and
qualified person, firm or corporation approved by the build-
ing official pursuant to Chapter 17 of this code.

[A] APPROVED SOURCE. An independent person, firm or
corporation, approved by the building official, who is compe-
tent and experienced in the application of engineering princi-
ples to materials, methods or systems analyses.

[BS] AREA (for masonry).
Gross cross-sectional. The area delineated by the out-to-
out specified dimensions of masonry in the plane under
consideration.

Net cross-sectional. The area of masonry units, grout and
mortar crossed by the plane under consideration based on
out-to-out specified dimensions.

[BG] AREA, BUILDING. The area included within sur-
rounding exterior walls, or exterior walls and fire walls,
exclusive of vent shafis and courts. Areas of the building not
provided with surrounding walls shall be included in the
building area if such areas are included within the horizontal
projection of the roof or floor above.

[BE] AREA OF REFUGE. An area where persons unable to
use stairways can remain temporarily to await instructions or
assistance during emergency evacuation.

[BE] AREA OF SPORT ACTIVITY. That portion of an
indoor or outdoor space where the play or practice of a sport
occurs.

[BG] AREAWAY. A subsurface space adjacent to a building
open at the top or protected at the top by a grating or guard.
ASSEMBLY SEATING, MULTILEVEL. See “Multilevel
assembly seating.”

[BG] ATRIUM. An opening connecting two or more stories
other than enclosed stairways, elevators, hoistways, escala-
tors, plumbing, electrical, air-conditioning or other equip-
ment, which is closed at the top and not defined as a mall.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION




the American Conference of Governmental Industrial
Hygienists (ACGIH), Ceiling Workplace Environmental
Exposure Level (WEEL-Ceiling) Guides published by the
American Industrial Hygiene Association (AIHA), and other
approved, consistent measures are allowed as surrogates for
hazardous substances not listed in DOL 29 CFR Part
1910.1000.

[BF] CEILING RADIATION DAMPER. A Ilisted device
installed in a ceiling membrane of a fire-resistance-rated
floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assembly to limit automatically
the radiative heat transfer through an air inlet/outlet opening.
Ceiling radiation dampers include air terminal units, ceiling
dampers and ceiling air diffusers.

[BG] CELL (Group I-3 occupancy). A room within a hous-
ing unit in a detention or correctional facility used to confine
inmates or prisoners.

[BS] CELL (masonry). A void space having a gross cross-
sectional area greater than 1'/, square inches (967 mm?).

[BG] CELL TIER. Levels of cells vertically stacked above
one another within a housing unit.

[BS] CEMENT PLASTER. A mixture of Portland or
blended cement, Portland cement or blended cement and
hydrated lime, masonry cement or plastic cement and aggre-
gate and other approved materials as specified in this code.

[BF] CERAMIC FIBER BLANKET. A high-temperature
mineral wool insulation material made of alumina-silica
ceramic or calcium magnesium silicate soluble fibers and
weighing 4 to 10 pounds per cubic foot (pcf) (64 to 160 kg/
m’).

[BS] CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE. A certificate
stating that materials and products meet specified standards
or that work was done in compliance with approved con-
struction documents.

[BG] CHILDREN’S PLAY STRUCTURE. A structure
composed of one or more components, where the user enters
a play environment.

[M] CHIMNEY. A primarily vertical structure containing
one or more flues, for the purpose of carrying gaseous prod-
ucts of combustion and air from a fuel-burning appliance to
the outdoor atmosphere.

Factory-built chimney. A [listed and labeled chimney
composed of factory-made components, assembled in the
field in accordance with manufacturer’s instructions and
the conditions of the listing.

Masonry chimney. A field-constructed chimney com-
posed of solid masonry units, bricks, stones, or concrete.

Metal chimney. A field-constructed chimney of metal.
[M] CHIMNEY TYPES.

High-heat appliance type. An approved chimney for
removing the products of combustion from fuel-burning,
high-heat appliances producing combustion gases in
excess of 2000°F (1093°C) measured at the appliance flue
outlet (see Section 2113.11.3).

Low-heat appliance type. An approved chimney for
removing the products of combustion from fuel-burning,
low-heat appliances producing combustion gases not in

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

DEFINITIONS

excess of 1000°F (538°C) under normal operating condi-
tions, but capable of producing combustion gases of
1400°F (760°C) during intermittent forces firing for peri-
ods up to 1 hour. Temperatures shall be measured at the
appliance flue outlet.

Masonry type. A field-constructed chimney of solid
masonry units or stones.
Medium-heat appliance type. An approved chimney for
removing the products of combustion from fuel-burning,
medium-heat appliances producing combustion gases not
exceeding 2000°F (1093°C) measured at the appliance
flue outlet (see Section 2113.11.2).
[BE] CIRCULATION PATH. An exterior or interior way
of passage from one place to another for pedestrians.

[F] CLEAN AGENT. Electrically nonconducting, volatile or
gaseous fire extinguishant that does not leave a residue upon
vaporation.

[BF] CLIMATE ZONE. A geographical region that has
been assigned climatic criteria as specified in Chapters 3CE
and 3RE of the International Energy Conservation Code.

[BG] CLINIC, OUTPATIENT. Buildings or portions
thereof used to provide medical care on less than a 24-hour
basis to persons where evacuation is slow.

[F] CLOSED SYSTEM. The use of a solid or liquid hazard-
ous material involving a closed vessel or system that remains
closed during normal operations where vapors emitted by the
product are not liberated outside of the vessel or system and
the product is not exposed to the atmosphere during normal
operations; and all uses of compressed gases. Examples of
closed systems for solids and liquids include product con-
veyed through a piping system into a closed vessel, system or
piece of equipment.

[BS] COASTAL A ZONE. Area within a special flood haz-
ard area, landward of a V zone or landward of an open coast
without mapped coastal high-hazard areas. In a coastal A
zone, the principal source of flooding must be astronomical
tides, storm surges, seiches or tsunamis, not riverine flooding.
During the base flood conditions, the potential for breaking
wave height shall be greater than or equal to 1'/, feet (457
mm). The inland limit of the coastal A zone is (a) the Limit of
Moderate Wave Action if delineated on a FIRM, or (b) desig-
nated by the authority having jurisdiction.

[BS] COASTAL HIGH-HAZARD AREA. Area within the
special flood hazard area extending from offshore to the
inland limit of a primary dune along an open coast and any
other area that is subject to high-velocity wave action from
storms or seismic sources, and shown on a Flood Insurance
Rate Map (FIRM) or other flood hazard map as velocity Zone
V, VO, VE or V1-30.

[BS] COLLAR JOINT. Vertical longitudinal space between
wythes of masonry or between masonry wythe and backup
construction that is permitted to be filled with mortar or
grout.

[BS] COLLECTOR. A horizontal diaphragm element paral-
lel and in line with the applied force that collects and trans-

fers diaphragm shear forces to the vertical elements of the
lateral force-resisting system or distributes forces within the

diaphragm, or both.



DEFINITIONS

[BF] COMBINATION FIRE/SMOKE DAMPER. A /isted
device installed in ducts and air transfer openings designed to
close automatically upon the detection of heat and resist the
passage of flame and smoke. The device is installed to oper-
ate automatically, controlled by a smoke detection system,
and where required, is capable of being positioned from a fire
command center.

[BS] COMBINED PILE RAFT. A geotechnical composite
construction that combines the bearing effect of both founda-
tion elements, raft and piles, by taking into account interac-
tions between the foundation elements and the subsoil.

[F] COMBUSTIBLE DUST. Finely divided solid material
that is 420 microns or less in diameter and which, when dis-
persed in air in the proper proportions, could be ignited by a
flame, spark or other source of ignition. Combustible dust
will pass through a U.S. No. 40 standard sieve.

[F] COMBUSTIBLE FIBERS. Readily ignitable and free-
burning materials in a fibrous or shredded form, such as
cocoa fiber, cloth, cotton, excelsior, hay, hemp, henequen,
istle, jute, kapok, oakum, rags, sisal, Spanish moss, straw,
tow, wastepaper, certain synthetic fibers or other like materi-
als. This definition does not include densely packed baled
cotton.

[F] COMBUSTIBLE LIQUID. A liguid having a closed
cup flash point at or above 100°F (38°C). Combustible lig-
uids shall be subdivided as follows:

Class II. Liquids having a closed cup flash point at or
above 100°F (38°C) and below 140°F (60°C).

Class IIIA. Liquids having a closed cup flash point at or
above 140°F (60°C) and below 200°F (93°C).

Class IIIB. Liguids having a closed cup flash point at or

above 200°F (93°C).

The category of combustible liquids does not include com-
pressed gases or cryogenic fluids.

[F] COMMERCIAL MOTOR VEHICLE. A motor vehi-
cle used to transport passengers or property where the motor
vehicle meets one of the following:

1. Has a gross vehicle weight rating of 10,000 pounds
(4540 kg) or more.

2. Is designed to transport 16 or more passengers, includ-
ing the driver.

[BE] COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL. That por-
tion of exit access travel distance measured from the most
remote point of each room, area or space to that point where
the occupants have separate and distinct access to two exits or
exit access doorways.

[BE] COMMON USE. Interior or exterior circulation paths,
rooms, spaces or elements that are not for public use and are
made available for the shared use of two or more people.

[F] COMPRESSED GAS. A material or mixture of materi-
als that meets both of the following:

1. Is a gas at 68°F (20°C) or less at 14.7 pounds per square
inch atmosphere (psia) (101 kPa) of pressure.

2. Has a boiling point of 68°F (20°C) or less at 14.7 psia
(101 kPa) which is either liquefied, nonliquefied or in
solution, except those gases which have no other
health- or physical-hazard properties are not considered

to be compressed until the pressure in the packaging
exceeds 41 psia (282 kPa) at 68°F (20°C).

The states of a compressed gas are categorized as follows:

1. Nonliquefied compressed gases are gases, other than
those in solution, which are in a packaging under the
charged pressure and are entirely gaseous at a tempera-
ture of 68°F (20°C).

2. Liquefied compressed gases are gases that, in a packag-
ing under the charged pressure, are partially liquid at a
temperature of 68°F (20°C).

3. Compressed gases in solution are nonliquefied gases
that are dissolved in a solvent.

4. Compressed gas mixtures consist of a mixture of two or
more compressed gases contained in a packaging, the
hazard properties of which are represented by the prop-
erties of the mixture as a whole.

[BS] CONCRETE.

Carbonate aggregate. Concrete made with aggregates
consisting mainly of calcium or magnesium carbonate,
such as limestone or dolomite, and containing 40 percent
or less quartz, chert or flint.

Cellular. A lightweight insulating concrete made by mix-
ing a preformed foam with Portland cement slurry and
having a dry unit weight of approximately 30 pcf (480 kg/
m’).

Lightweight aggregate. Concrete made with aggregates
of expanded clay, shale, slag or slate or sintered fly ash or
any natural lightweight aggregate meeting ASTM C330
and possessing equivalent fire-resistance properties and
weighing 85 to 115 pef (1360 to 1840 kg/m?).

Perlite. A lightweight insulating concrete having a dry
unit weight of approximately 30 pcf (480 kg/m’) made
with perlite concrete aggregate. Perlite aggregate is pro-
duced from a volcanic rock which, when heated, expands
to form a glass-like material of cellular structure.

Sand-lightweight. Concrete made with a combination of
expanded clay, shale, slag, slate, sintered fly ash, or any
natural lightweight aggregate meeting ASTM C330 and
possessing equivalent fire-resistance properties and natu-
ral sand. Its unit weight is generally between 105 and 120
pef (1680 and 1920 kg/m?).

Siliceous aggregate. Concrete made with normal-weight
aggregates consisting mainly of silica or compounds other
than calcium or magnesium carbonate, which contains
more than 40-percent quartz, chert or flint.
Vermiculite. A light weight insulating concrete made
with vermiculite concrete aggregate which is laminated
micaceous material produced by expanding the ore at high
temperatures. When added to a Portland cement slurry the
resulting concrete has a dry unit weight of approximately
30 pef (480 kg/m?).
[BG] CONGREGATE LIVING FACILITIES. A building
or part thereof that contains sleeping units where residents
share bathroom or kitchen facilities, or both.

[F] CONSTANTLY ATTENDED LOCATION. A desig-
nated location at a facility staffed by trained personnel on a
continuous basis where alarm or supervisory signals are mon-

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



where evacuation is impractical.

[BS] DIAPHRAGM. A horizontal or sloped system acting to
transmit lateral forces to vertical elements of the lateral force-
resisting system. When the term “diaphragm” is used, it shall
include horizontal bracing systems.

Diaphragm, blocked. In /ight-frame construction, a dia-
phragm in which all sheathing edges not occurring on a
framing member are supported on and fastened to block-
ing.

Diaphragm boundary. In [light-frame construction, a
location where shear is transferred into or out of the dia-
phragm sheathing. Transfer is either to a boundary ele-
ment or to another force-resisting element.

Diaphragm chord. A diaphragm boundary element per-

pendicular to the applied load that is assumed to take axial
stresses due to the diaphragm moment.

Diaphragm, unblocked. A diaphragm that has edge nail-
ing at supporting members only. Blocking between sup-
porting structural members at panel edges is not included.
Diaphragm panels are field nailed to supporting members.

[BS] DIMENSIONS (for Chapter 21).

Nominal. The specified dimension plus an allowance for
the joints with which the units are to be laid. Nominal
dimensions are usually stated in whole numbers. Thick-
ness is given first, followed by height and then length.

Specified. Dimensions specified for the manufacture or
construction of a unit, joint or element.

[BE] DIRECT ACCESS. A path of travel from a space to an
immediately adjacent space through an opening in the com-
mon wall between the two spaces.

[F] DISPENSING. The pouring or transferring of any mate-
rial from a container, tank or similar vessel, whereby vapors,
dusts, fumes, mists or gases are liberated to the atmosphere.

DOOR, BALANCED. See “Balanced door.”

DOOR, LOW-ENERGY POWER-OPERATED. Sece
“Low-energy power-operated door.”

DOOR, POWER-ASSISTED. See “Power-assisted door.”
DOOR, POWER-OPERATED. See “Power-operated door.”
DOORWAY, EXIT ACCESS. See “Exit access doorway.”

[BG] DORMITORY. A space in a building where group
sleeping accommodations are provided in one room, or in a
series of closely associated rooms, for persons not members
of the same family group, under joint occupancy and single
management, as in college dormitories or fraternity houses.

[BF] DRAFTSTOP. A material, device or construction
installed to restrict the movement of air within open spaces of
concealed areas of building components such as crawl spaces,
floor/ceiling assemblies, roof/ceiling assemblies and attics.

DRAG STRUT. See “Collector.”

[BS] DRILLED SHAFT. A cast-in-place deep foundation
element, also referred to as a caisson, drilled pier or bored
pile, constructed by drilling a hole (with or without perma-

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

DEFINITIONS

nent casing or drilling fluid) into soil or rock and filling it
with fluid concrete after the drilling equipment is removed.

Socketed drilled shaft. A drilled shaft with a permanent
pipe or tube casing that extends down to bedrock and an
uncased socket drilled into the bedrock.

[F] DRY-CHEMICAL EXTINGUISHING AGENT. A
powder composed of small particles, usually of sodium bicar-
bonate, potassium bicarbonate, urea-potassium-based bicar-
bonate, potassium chloride or monoammonium phosphate,
with added particulate material supplemented by special
treatment to provide resistance to packing, resistance to mois-
ture absorption (caking) and the proper flow capabilities.

[BS] DRY FLOODPROOFING. A combination of design
modifications that results in a building or structure, including
the attendant utilities and equipment and sanitary facilities,
being watertight with walls substantially impermeable to the
passage of water and with structural components having the
capacity to resist loads as identified in ASCE 7.

[A] DWELLING. A building that contains one or two dwell-
ing units used, intended or designed to be used, rented,
leased, let or hired out to be occupied for living purposes.

[A] DWELLING UNIT. A single unit providing complete,
independent living facilities for one or more persons living as
a single housekeeping unit, including permanent provisions
for living, sleeping, eating, cooking and sanitation.

DWELLING UNIT OR SLEEPING UNIT, MULTI-
STORY. See “Multistory unit.”

[BE] EGRESS COURT. A court or yard which provides
access to a public way for one or more exits.

[BF] ELECTRICAL CIRCUIT PROTECTIVE SYS-
TEM. A specific construction of devices, materials, or coat-
ings installed as a fire-resistive barrier system applied to
electrical system components, such as cable trays, conduits
and other raceways, open run cables and conductors, cables,
and conductors.

[F] ELEVATOR GROUP. A grouping of elevators in a
building located adjacent or directly across from one another
that responds to common hall call buttons.

[F] EMERGENCY ALARM SYSTEM. A system to pro-
vide indication and warning of emergency situations involv-
ing hazardous materials.

[F] EMERGENCY CONTROL STATION. An approved
location on the premises where signals from emergency
equipment are received and which is staffed by trained per-
sonnel.

[IBE] EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPEN-
ING. An operable window, door or other similar device that
provides for a means of escape and access for rescue in the
event of an emergency.

[F] EMERGENCY POWER SYSTEM. A source of auto-
matic electric power of a required capacity and duration to
operate required life safety, fire alarm, detection and ventila-
tion systems in the event of a failure of the primary power.
Emergency power systems are required for electrical loads
where interruption of the primary power could result in loss
of human life or serious injuries.

11



DEFINITIONS

[F] EMERGENCY VOICE/ALARM COMMUNICA-
TIONS. Dedicated manual or automatic facilities for origi-
nating and distributing voice instructions, as well as alert and
evacuation signals pertaining to a fire emergency, to the
occupants of a building.

[BE] EMPLOYEE WORK AREA. All or any portion of a
space used only by employees and only for work. Corridors,
toilet rooms, kitchenettes and break rooms are not employee
work areas.

[BS] ENGINEERED WOOD RIM BOARD. A full-depth
structural composite lumber, wood structural panel, structural
glued laminated timber or prefabricated wood I-joist member
designed to transfer horizontal (shear) and vertical (compres-
sion) loads, provide attachment for diaphragm sheathing, sid-
ing and exterior deck ledgers, and provide lateral support at
the ends of floor or roof joists or rafters.

ENTRANCE, PUBLIC. See “Public entrance.”
ENTRANCE, RESTRICTED. See “Restricted entrance.”
ENTRANCE, SERVICE. See “Service entrance.”

[BG] EQUIPMENT PLATFORM. An unoccupied, ele-
vated platform used exclusively for mechanical systems or
industrial process equipment, including the associated ele-
vated walkways, stairways, alternating tread devices and lad-
ders necessary to access the platform (see Section 505.3).

[BS] ESSENTIAL FACILITIES. Buildings and other struc-
tures that are intended to remain operational in the event of
extreme environmental loading from flood, wind, snow or
earthquakes.

EVACUATION, IMPRACTICAL. The movement of all
occupants, residents and staff to an exit in more than 13 min-
utes.

EVACUATION, SLOW. The movement of all occupants,
residents and staff to an exit in more than 3 minutes, but not
more than 13 minutes.

[F] EXHAUSTED ENCLOSURE. An appliance or piece of
equipment that consists of a top, a back and two sides provid-
ing a means of local exhaust for capturing gases, fumes,
vapors and mists. Such enclosures include laboratory hoods,
exhaust fume hoods and similar appliances and equipment
used to locally retain and exhaust the gases, fumes, vapors
and mists that could be released. Rooms or areas provided
with general ventilation, in themselves, are not exhausted
enclosures.

[BE] EXIT. That portion of a means of egress system
between the exit access and the exit discharge or public way.
Exit components include exterior exit doors at the level of exit
discharge, interior exit stairways and ramps, exit passage-
ways, exterior exit stairways and ramps and horizontal exits.

[BE] EXIT ACCESS. That portion of a means of egress sys-
tem that leads from any occupied portion of a building or
structure to an exit.

[BE] EXIT ACCESS DOORWAY. A door or access point
along the path of egress travel from an occupied room, area or
space where the path of egress enters an intervening room,
corridor, exit access stairway or ramp.

12

[BE] EXIT ACCESS RAMP. A ramp within the exit access
portion of the means of egress system.

[BE] EXIT ACCESS STAIRWAY. A stairway within the
exit access portion of the means of egress system.

[BE] EXIT DISCHARGE. That portion of a means of
egress system between the termination of an exit and a public
way.

[BE] EXIT DISCHARGE, LEVEL OF. The story at the
point at which an exit terminates and an exit discharge
begins.

EXIT, HORIZONTAL. See “Horizontal exit.”

[BE] EXIT PASSAGEWAY. An exit component that is sep-
arated from other interior spaces of a building or structure by
fire-resistance-rated construction and opening protectives,
and provides for a protected path of egress travel in a hori-
zontal direction to an exit or to the exit discharge.

[BF] EXPANDED VINYL WALL COVERING. Wall cov-
ering consisting of a woven textile backing, an expanded
vinyl base coat layer and a nonexpanded vinyl skin coat. The
expanded base coat layer is a homogeneous vinyl layer that
contains a blowing agent. During processing, the blowing
agent decomposes, causing this layer to expand by forming
closed cells. The total thickness of the wall covering is
approximately 0.055 inch to 0.070 inch (1.4 mm to 1.78 mm).

[F] EXPLOSION. An effect produced by the sudden violent
expansion of gases, which may be accompanied by a shock
wave or disruption, or both, of enclosing materials or struc-
tures. An explosion could result from any of the following:

1. Chemical changes such as rapid oxidation, deflagration
or detonation, decomposition of molecules and run-
away polymerization (usually detonations).

2. Physical changes such as pressure tank ruptures.
3. Atomic changes (nuclear fission or fusion).

[F] EXPLOSIVE. A chemical compound, mixture or device,
the primary or common purpose of which is to function by
explosion. The term includes, but is not limited to: dynamite,
black powder, pellet powder, initiating explosives, detona-
tors, safety fuses, squibs, detonating cord, igniter cord, and
igniters.

The term “explosive” includes any material determined to
be within the scope of USC Title 18: Chapter 40 and also
includes any material classified as an explosive other than
consumer fireworks, 1.4G by the hazardous materials regula-
tions of DOTn 49 CFR Parts 100-185.

High explosive. Explosive material, such as dynamite,
which can be caused to detonate by means of a No. 8 test
blasting cap when unconfined.

Low explosive. Explosive material that will burn or defla-
grate when ignited. It is characterized by a rate of reaction
that is less than the speed of sound. Examples of low
explosives include, but are not limited to: black powder;
safety fuse; igniters; igniter cord; fuse lighters; fireworks;
and propellants, 1.3C.

Mass-detonating explosives. Division 1.1, 1.2 and 1.5
explosives alone or in combination, or loaded into various
types of ammunition or containers, most of which can be

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

Copyright © 2019 by, or licensed to, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); licensed to the New Jersey Department of Community Affairs Division of Codes and Standards pursuant to License Agreement.
No further reproductions by any third party is authorized. Any unauthorized reproduction or distribution is a violation of the federal copyright act and the license agreement, and subject to civil and criminal penalties thereunder.



[BE] GAMING. To deal, operate, carry on, conduct, main-
tain or expose for play any game played with cards, dice,
equipment or any mechanical, electromechanical or elec-
tronic device or machine for money, property, checks, credit
or any representative of value except where occurring at pri-
vate home or operated by a charitable or educational organi-
zation.

[BE] GAMING AREA. Single or multiple areas of a build-
ing or facility where gaming machines or tables are present
and gaming occurs, including but not limited to, primary
casino gaming areas, VIP gaming areas, high-roller gaming
areas, bar tops, lobbies, dedicated rooms or spaces such as in
retail or restaurant establishments, sports books and tourna-
ment areas.

[BE] GAMING MACHINE TYPE. Categorization of gam-
ing machines per type of game played on them, including, but
not limited to, slot machines, video poker and video keno.

[BE] GAMING TABLE TYPE. Categorization of gaming
tables per the type of game played on them, including, but not
limited to, baccarat, bingo, blackjack/21, craps, pai gow,
poker, roulette.

[F] GAS CABINET. A fully enclosed, ventilated noncom-
bustible enclosure used to provide an isolated environment
for compressed gas cylinders in storage or use. Doors and
access ports for exchanging cylinders and accessing pressure-
regulating controls are allowed to be included.

[F] GAS DETECTION SYSTEM. A system or portion of a
combination system that utilizes one or more stationary sen-
sors to detect the presence of a specified gas at a specified
concentration and initiate one or more responses required by
this code, such as notifying a responsible person, activating
an alarm signal, or activating or deactivating equipment. A
self-contained gas detection and alarm device is not classified
as a gas detection system.

[F] GAS ROOM. A separately ventilated, fully enclosed
room in which only compressed gases and associated equip-
ment and supplies are stored or used.

[F] GASEOUS HYDROGEN SYSTEM. An assembly of
piping, devices and apparatus designed to generate, store,
contain, distribute or transport a nontoxic, gaseous hydrogen-
containing mixture having not less than 95-percent hydrogen
gas by volume and not more than 1-percent oxygen by vol-
ume. Gaseous hydrogen systems consist of items such as
compressed gas containers, reactors and appurtenances,
including pressure regulators, pressure relief devices, mani-
folds, pumps, compressors and interconnecting piping and
tubing and controls.

[BF] GLASS FIBERBOARD. Fibrous glass roof insulation
consisting of inorganic glass fibers formed into rigid boards
using a binder. The board has a top surface faced with asphalt
and kraft reinforced with glass fiber.

[BS] GRADE (LUMBER). The classification of lumber in
regard to strength and utility in accordance with American
Softwood Lumber Standard DOC PS 20 and the grading rules
of an approved lumber rules-writing agency.

[BE] GRADE FLOOR OPENING. A window or other
opening located such that the sill height of the opening is not

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

DEFINITIONS

more than 44 inches (1118 mm) above or below the finished
ground level adjacent to the opening.

[BG] GRADE PLANE. A reference plane representing the
average of finished ground level adjoining the building at
exterior walls. Where the finished ground level slopes away
from the exterior walls, the reference plane shall be estab-
lished by the lowest points within the area between the build-
ing and the /ot line or, where the /ot line is more than 6 feet
(1829 mm) from the building, between the building and a
point 6 feet (1829 mm) from the building.

GRADE PLANE, STORY ABOVE. See “Story above
grade plane.”

[BE] GRANDSTAND. Tiered seating supported on a dedi-
cated structural system and two or more rows high and is not
a building element (see “Bleachers”).

[BG] GREENHOUSE. A structure or thermally isolated
area of a building that maintains a specialized sunlit environ-
ment used for and essential to the cultivation, protection or
maintenance of plants.

[BG] GROSS LEASABLE AREA. The total floor area
designed for tenant occupancy and exclusive use. The area of
tenant occupancy is measured from the centerlines of joint
partitions to the outside of the tenant walls. All tenant areas,
including areas used for storage, shall be included in calculat-
ing gross leasable area.

[BG] GROUP HOME. A facility for social rehabilitation,
substance abuse or mental health problems that contains a
group housing arrangement that provides custodial care but
does not provide medical care.

[BE] GUARD. A building component or a system of build-
ing components located at or near the open sides of elevated
walking surfaces that minimizes the possibility of a fall from
the walking surface to a lower level.

[BG] GUESTROOM. A room used or intended to be used
by one or more guests for living or sleeping purposes.

[BS] GYPSUM BOARD. The generic name for a family of
sheet products consisting of a noncombustible core primarily
of gypsum with paper surfacing. Gypsum wallboard, gypsum
sheathing, gypsum base for gypsum veneer plaster, exterior
gypsum soffit board, predecorated gypsum board and water-
resistant gypsum backing board complying with the standards
listed in Tables 2506.2, 2507.2 and Chapter 35 are types of
gypsum board.

[BS] GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCT. The general name for
a family of sheet products consisting essentially of gypsum.

[BS] GYPSUM PLASTER. A mixture of calcined gypsum
or calcined gypsum and lime and aggregate and other
approved materials as specified in this code.

[BS] GYPSUM VENEER PLASTER. Gypsum plaster
applied to an approved base in one or more coats normally
not exceeding '/, inch (6.4 mm) in total thickness.

[BG] HABITABLE SPACE. A space in a building for liv-
ing, sleeping, eating or cooking. Bathrooms, toilet rooms,
closets, halls, storage or utility spaces and similar areas are
not considered habitable spaces.

17



DEFINITIONS

[F] HALOGENATED EXTINGUISHING SYSTEM. A
fire-extinguishing system using one or more atoms of an ele-
ment from the halogen chemical series: fluorine, chlorine,
bromine and iodine.

[F] HANDLING. The deliberate transport by any means to a
point of storage or use.

[BE] HANDRAIL. A horizontal or sloping rail intended for
grasping by the hand for guidance or support.

[BS] HARDBOARD. A fibrous-felted, homogeneous panel
made from lignocellulosic fibers consolidated under heat and
pressure in a hot press to a density not less than 31 pcf (497 kg/
m’).

HARDWARE. See “Fire exit hardware” and “Panic hard-
ware.”

[F] HAZARDOUS MATERIALS. Those chemicals or sub-
stances that are physical hazards or health hazards as classi-
fied in Section 307 and the International Fire Code, whether
the materials are in usable or waste condition.

[F] HAZARDOUS PRODUCTION MATERIAL (HPM).
A solid, liquid or gas associated with semiconductor manu-
facturing that has a degree-of-hazard rating in health, flam-
mability or instability of Class 3 or 4 as ranked by NFPA 704
and which is used directly in research, laboratory or produc-
tion processes which have as their end product materials that
are not hazardous.

[BS] HEAD JOINT. Vertical mortar joint placed between
masonry units within the wythe at the time the masonry units
are laid.

[F] HEALTH HAZARD. A classification of a chemical for
which there is statistically significant evidence that acute or
chronic health effects are capable of occurring in exposed
persons. The term “health hazard” includes chemicals that are
toxic or highly toxic, and corrosive.

HEAT DETECTOR. See “Detector, heat.”

[BG] HEIGHT, BUILDING. The vertical distance from
grade plane to the average height of the highest roof surface.

[BS] HELICAL PILE. Manufactured steel deep foundation
element consisting of a central shaft and one or more helical
bearing plates. A helical pile is installed by rotating it into the
ground. Each helical bearing plate is formed into a screw
thread with a uniform defined pitch.

[F] HELIPAD. A structural surface that is used for the land-
ing, taking off, taxiing and parking of helicopters.

[F] HELIPORT. An area of land or water or a structural sur-
face that is used, or intended for use, for the landing and tak-
ing off of helicopters, and any appurtenant areas that are
used, or intended for use, for heliport buildings or other heli-
port facilities.

[F] HELISTOP. The same as “heliport,” except that no fuel-
ing, defueling, maintenance, repairs or storage of helicopters
is permitted.

[F] HIGHER EDUCATION LABORATORY. Laborato-
ries in Group B occupancies used for educational purposes
above the 12th grade. Storage, use and handling of chemicals
in such laboratories shall be limited to purposes related to

18

testing, analysis, teaching, research or developmental activi-
ties on a nonproduction basis.

[F] HIGHLY TOXIC. A material which produces a lethal
dose or lethal concentration that falls within any of the fol-
lowing categories:

1. A chemical that has a median lethal dose (LDs,) of 50
milligrams or less per kilogram of body weight when
administered orally to albino rats weighing between
200 and 300 grams each.

2. A chemical that has a median lethal dose (LD,,) of 200
milligrams or less per kilogram of body weight when
administered by continuous contact for 24 hours (or
less if death occurs within 24 hours) with the bare skin
of albino rabbits weighing between 2 and 3 kilograms
each.

3. A chemical that has a median lethal concentration
(LC,,) in air of 200 parts per million by volume or less
of gas or vapor, or 2 milligrams per liter or less of mist,
fume or dust, when administered by continuous inhala-
tion for 1 hour (or less if death occurs within 1 hour) to
albino rats weighing between 200 and 300 grams each.

Mixtures of these materials with ordinary materials, such
as water, might not warrant classification as highly toxic.
While this system is basically simple in application, any haz-
ard evaluation that is required for the precise categorization
of this type of material shall be performed by experienced,
technically competent persons.

[BF] HIGH-PRESSURE DECORATIVE EXTERIOR-
GRADE COMPACT LAMINATE (HPL). Panels consist-
ing of layers of cellulose fibrous material impregnated with
thermosetting resins and bonded together by a high-pressure
process to form a homogeneous nonporous core suitable for
exterior use.

[BF] HIGH-PRESSURE DECORATIVE EXTERIOR-
GRADE COMPACT LAMINATE (HPL) SYSTEM. An
exterior wall covering fabricated using HPL in a specific
assembly including joints, seams, attachments, substrate,
framing and other details as appropriate to a particular design.

[BG] HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occu-
pied floor located more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above the
lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

[BF| HORIZONTAL ASSEMBLY. A fire-resistance-rated
floor or roof assembly of materials designed to restrict the
spread of fire in which continuity is maintained.

[BE] HORIZONTAL EXIT. An exit component consisting
of fire-resistance-rated construction and opening protectives
intended to compartmentalize portions of a building thereby
creating refuge areas that afford safety from the fire and
smoke from the area of fire origin.

[BG] HOSPITALS AND PSYCHIATRIC HOSPITALS.
Facilities that provide care or treatment for the medical, psy-
chiatric, obstetrical, or surgical treatment of care recipients
where evacuation is impractical.

[BG] HOUSING UNIT. A dormitory or a group of cells with
a common dayroom in Group I-3.

HPM. See “Hazardous Production Material.”

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



enclosure is not built so as to render the structure in violation
of Section 1612.

[BS] MAIN WINDFORCE-RESISTING SYSTEM. An
assemblage of structural elements assigned to provide sup-
port and stability for the overall structure. The system gener-
ally receives wind loading from more than one surface

MALL BUILDING, COVERED and MALL BUILDING,
OPEN. See “Covered mall building.”

[F] MANUAL FIRE ALARM BOX. A manually operated
device used to initiate an alarm signal.

[A] MANUFACTURER’S DESIGNATION. An identifica-
tion applied on a product by the manufacturer indicating that
a product or material complies with a specified standard or
set of rules (see “Label” and “Mark™).

[A] MARK. An identification applied on a product by the
manufacturer indicating the name of the manufacturer and the
function of a product or material (see “Label” and “Manufac-
turer’s designation”).

[BG] MARQUEE. A canopy that has a top surface which is
sloped less than 25 degrees from the horizontal and is located
less than 10 feet (3048 mm) from operable openings above or
adjacent to the level of the marquee.

[BS] MASONRY. A built-up construction or combination of
building units or materials of clay, shale, concrete, glass, gyp-
sum, stone or other approved units bonded together with or
without mortar or grout or other accepted methods of joining.

Glass unit masonry. Masonry composed of glass units
bonded by mortar.

Plain masonry. Masonry in which the tensile resistance of
the masonry is taken into consideration and the effects of
stresses in reinforcement are neglected.

Reinforced masonry. Masonry construction in which
reinforcement acting in conjunction with the masonry is
used to resist forces.

Solid masonry. Masonry consisting of solid masonry
units laid contiguously with the joints between the units
filled with mortar.

Unreinforced (plain) masonry. Masonry in which the
tensile resistance of masonry is taken into consideration
and the resistance of the reinforcing steel, if present, is
neglected.

[BS] MASONRY UNIT. Brick, tile, stone, glass block or
concrete block conforming to the requirements specified in
Section 2103.

Hollow. A masonry unit whose net cross-sectional area in
any plane parallel to the load-bearing surface is less than
75 percent of its gross cross-sectional area measured in
the same plane.

Solid. A masonry unit whose net cross-sectional area in
every plane parallel to the load-bearing surface is 75 per-
cent or more of its gross cross-sectional area measured in
the same plane.

[BF] MASTIC FIRE-RESISTANT COATINGS. Liquid
mixture applied to a substrate by brush, roller, spray or trowel
that provides fire-resistant protection of a substrate when
exposed to flame or intense heat.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

DEFINITIONS

[BE] MEANS OF EGRESS. A continuous and unobstructed
path of vertical and horizontal egress travel from any occu-
pied portion of a building or structure to a public way. A
means of egress consists of three separate and distinct parts:
the exit access, the exit and the exit discharge.

[BG] MECHANICAL-ACCESS OPEN PARKING
GARAGES. Open parking garages employing parking
machines, lifts, elevators or other mechanical devices for
vehicles moving from and to street level and in which public
occupancy is prohibited above the street level.

[BF] MECHANICAL EQUIPMENT SCREEN. A rooftop
structure, not covered by a roof, used to aesthetically conceal
plumbing, electrical or mechanical equipment from view.

[BG] MEDICAL CARE. Care involving medical or surgical
procedures, nursing or for psychiatric purposes.

[BG] MEMBRANE-COVERED CABLE STRUCTURE.
A nonpressurized structure in which a mast and cable system
provides support and tension to the membrane weather bar-
rier and the membrane imparts stability to the structure.

[BG] MEMBRANE-COVERED FRAME STRUCTURE.
A nonpressurized building wherein the structure is composed
of a rigid framework to support a tensioned membrane which
provides the weather barrier.

[BF| MEMBRANE PENETRATION. A breach in one side
of a floor-ceiling, roof-ceiling or wall assembly to accommo-
date an item installed into or passing through the breach.

[BF] MEMBRANE-PENETRATION FIRESTOP. A
material, device or construction installed to resist for a pre-
scribed time period the passage of flame and heat through
openings in a protective membrane in order to accommodate
cables, cable trays, conduit, tubing, pipes or similar items.

[BF] MEMBRANE-PENETRATION FIRESTOP SYS-
TEM. An assemblage consisting of a fire-resistance-rated
floor-ceiling, roof-ceiling or wall assembly, one or more pen-
etrating items installed into or passing through the breach in
one side of the assembly and the materials or devices, or both,
installed to resist the spread of fire into the assembly for a
prescribed period of time.

[BE] MERCHANDISE PAD. A merchandise pad is an area
for display of merchandise surrounded by aisles, permanent
fixtures or walls. Merchandise pads contain elements such as
nonfixed and moveable fixtures, cases, racks, counters and
partitions from which customers browse or shop.

[BF| METAL COMPOSITE MATERIAL (MCM). A fac-
tory-manufactured panel consisting of metal skins bonded to
both faces of a solid plastic core.

[BF] METAL COMPOSITE MATERIAL (MCM) SYS-
TEM. An exterior wall covering fabricated using MCM in a
specific assembly including joints, seams, attachments, sub-
strate, framing and other details as appropriate to a particular
design.

[BS] METAL ROOF PANEL. An interlocking metal sheet
having a minimum installed weather exposure of 3 square
feet (0.279 m?) per sheet.

[BS] METAL ROOF SHINGLE. An interlocking metal
sheet having an installed weather exposure less than 3 square
feet (0.279 m?) per sheet.

21



DEFINITIONS

[BG] MEZZANINE. An intermediate level or levels
between the floor and ceiling of any story and in accordance
with Section 505.

[BS] MICROPILE. A micropile is a bored, grouted-in-place
deep foundation element that develops its load-carrying
capacity by means of a bond zone in soil, bedrock or a combi-
nation of soil and bedrock.

[BF] MINERAL BOARD. A rigid felted thermal insulation
board consisting of either felted mineral fiber or cellular
beads of expanded aggregate formed into flat rectangular
units.

[BF] MINERAL FIBER. Insulation composed principally
of fibers manufactured from rock, slag or glass, with or with-
out binders.

[BF] MINERAL WOOL. Synthetic vitreous fiber insulation
made by melting predominately igneous rock or furnace slag,
and other inorganic materials, and then physically forming
the melt into fibers.

[BS] MODIFIED BITUMEN ROOF COVERING. One or
more layers of polymer-modified asphalt sheets. The sheet
materials shall be fully adhered or mechanically attached to
the substrate or held in place with an approved ballast layer.

[BS] MORTAR. A mixture consisting of cementitious mate-
rials, fine aggregates, water, with or without admixtures, that
is used to construct unit masonry assemblies.

[BS] MORTAR, SURFACE-BONDING. A mixture to
bond concrete masonry units that contains hydraulic cement,
glass fiber reinforcement with or without inorganic fillers or
organic modifiers and water.

[BE] MULTILEVEL ASSEMBLY SEATING. Seating
that is arranged in distinct levels where each level is com-
prised of either multiple rows, or a single row of box seats
accessed from a separate level.

[F] MULTIPLE-STATION ALARM DEVICE. Two or
more single-station alarm devices that can be interconnected
such that actuation of one causes all integral or separate audi-
ble alarms to operate. A multiple-station alarm device can
consist of one single-station alarm device having connections
to other detectors or to a manual fire alarm box.

[F] MULTIPLE-STATION SMOKE ALARM. Two or
more single-station alarm devices that are capable of inter-
connection such that actuation of one causes the appropriate
alarm signal to operate in all interconnected alarms.

[BE] MULTISTORY UNIT. A dwelling unit or sleeping
unit with habitable space located on more than one story.

[BS] NAILING, BOUNDARY. A special nailing pattern
required by design at the boundaries of diaphragms.

[BS] NAILING, EDGE. A special nailing pattern required
by design at the edges of each panel within the assembly of a
diaphragm or shear wall.

[BS] NAILING, FIELD. Nailing required between the
sheathing panels and framing members at locations other than
boundary nailing and edge nailing.

[BS]| NATURALLY DURABLE WOOD. The heartwood of
the following species except for the occasional piece with

22

corner sapwood, provided 90 percent or more of the width of
each side on which it occurs is heartwood.

Decay resistant. Redwood, cedar, black locust and black
walnut.

Termite resistant. Redwood, Alaska yellow cedar, East-
ern red cedar and Western red cedar.

NIGHTCLUB. All buildings and places of public assembly
designed for use as dance halls, eating and/or drinking estab-
lishments, and similar occupancies, in which the established
maximum permitted occupant load exceeds the number of
seats provided by more than 30 percent or which affords less
than 12 square feet net area per occupant. For purposes of
determining the net area per occupant, only the actual public
assembly room or rooms shall be considered. For purposes of
applying the requirements of this code, the nightclub shall
include all rooms, lobbies and other spaces connected thereto
with a common means of egress and entrance.

[BS] NOMINAL LOADS. The magnitudes of the loads
specified in Chapter 16 (dead, live, soil, wind, snow, rain,
flood and earthquake).

[BS] NOMINAL SIZE (LUMBER). The commercial size
designation of width and depth, in standard sawn lumber and
glued-laminated lumber grades; somewhat larger than the
standard net size of dressed lumber, in accordance with
DOCPS 20 for sawn lumber and with the ANSI/AWC NDS
for glued-laminated lumber.

[BG] NONCOMBUSTIBLE MEMBRANE STRUC-
TURE. A membrane structure in which the membrane and all
component parts of the structure are noncombustible.

[BS] NONSTRUCTURAL CONCRETE. Any element
made of plain or reinforced concrete that is not part of a struc-
tural system required to transfer either gravity or lateral loads
to the ground.

[F] NORMAL TEMPERATURE AND PRESSURE
(NTP). A temperature of 70°F (21°C) and a pressure of 1
atmosphere [14.7 psia (101 kPa)].

[BE] NOSING. The leading edge of treads of stairs and of
landings at the top of stairway flights.

NOTIFICATION ZONE. See “Zone, notification.”

[F] NUISANCE ALARM. An alarm caused by mechanical
failure, malfunction, improper installation or lack of proper
maintenance, or an alarm activated by a cause that cannot be
determined.

[BG] NURSING HOMES. Facilities that provide care,
including both intermediate care facilities and skilled nursing
facilities where any of the persons are of impractical
evacuation.

[BE] OCCUPANT LOAD. The number of persons for
which the means of egress of a building or portion thereof is
designed.

[BG] OCCUPIABLE SPACE. A room or enclosed space
designed for human occupancy in which individuals congre-
gate for amusement, educational or similar purposes or in
which occupants are engaged at labor, and which is equipped
with means of egress and light and ventilation facilities meet-
ing the requirements of this code.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION




ants of the building or buildings on the premises are stored or
kept, without provisions for repairing or servicing such vehi-
cles for profit.

[BG] PROSCENIUM WALL. The wall that separates the
stage from the auditorium or assembly seating area.

PSYCHIATRIC HOSPITALS. See “Hospitals.”

[BE] PUBLIC ENTRANCE. An entrance that is not a ser-
vice entrance or a restricted entrance.

[A] PUBLIC WAY. A street, alley or other parcel of land
open to the outside air leading to a street, that has been
deeded, dedicated or otherwise permanently appropriated to
the public for public use and which has a clear width and
height of not less than 10 feet (3048 mm).

[BE] PUBLIC-USE AREAS. Interior or exterior rooms or
spaces that are made available to the general public.

[F] PYROPHORIC. A chemical with an auto-ignition tem-
perature in air, at or below a temperature of 130°F (54.4°C).
[F] PYROTECHNIC COMPOSITION. A chemical mix-
ture that produces visible light displays or sounds through a
self-propagating, heat-releasing chemical reaction which is
initiated by ignition.

[BF] RADIANT BARRIER. A material having a low-emit-
tance surface of 0.1 or less installed in building assemblies.
RADIOACTIVE MATERIAL. Any material or combina-
tion of materials that spontaneously emit ionizing radiation.
[BE] RAMP. A walking surface that has a running slope
steeper than one unit vertical in 20 units horizontal (5-percent
slope).

RAMP, EXIT ACCESS. See “Exit access ramp.”

RAMP, EXTERIOR EXIT. See “Exterior exit ramp.”
RAMP, INTERIOR EXIT. See “Interior exit ramp.”

[BG] RAMP-ACCESS OPEN PARKING GARAGES.
Open parking garages employing a series of continuously
rising floors or a series of interconnecting ramps between
floors permitting the movement of vehicles under their own
power from and to the street level.

[A] RECORD DRAWINGS. Drawings (“as builts”) that
document the location of all devices, appliances, wiring
sequences, wiring methods and connections of the compo-
nents of a fire alarm system as installed.

[BF] REFLECTIVE PLASTIC CORE INSULATION. An
insulation material packaged in rolls, that is less than '/, inch
(12.7 mm) thick, with not less than one exterior low-emit-
tance surface (0.1 or less) and a core material containing
voids or cells.

[A] REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL. An indi-
vidual who is registered or licensed to practice their respec-
tive design profession as defined by the statutory
requirements of the professional registration laws of the state
or jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed.

[BG] RELIGIOUS WORSHIP, PLACE OF. A building or
portion thereof intended for the performance of religious ser-
vices.

[BG] REPAIR GARAGE. A building, structure or portion
thereof used for servicing or repairing motor vehicles.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

DEFINITIONS

[BS] REROOFING. The process of recovering or replacing
an existing roof covering. See “Roof recover” and “Roof
replacement.”

[BG] RESIDENTIAL AIRCRAFT HANGAR. An acces-
sory building less than 2,000 square feet (186 m?) and 20 feet
(6096 mm) in building height constructed on a one- or two-
family property where aircraft are stored. Such use will be
considered as a residential accessory use incidental to the
dwelling.

RESIDENTIAL HEALTH CARE FACILITY. A facility
not located with, and operated by, a licensed health care facil-
ity that provides food, shelter, supervised health care and
related services, in a homelike setting, to four or more per-
sons 18 years of age or older who are unrelated to the owner
or administrator.

[BS] RESISTANCE FACTOR. A factor that accounts for
deviations of the actual strength from the nominal strength
and the manner and consequences of failure (also called
“strength reduction factor”).

[BE] RESTRICTED ENTRANCE. An entrance that is
made available for common use on a controlled basis, but not
public use, and that is not a service entrance.

[BG] RETRACTABLE AWNING. A retractable awning is
a cover with a frame that retracts against a building or other
structure to which it is entirely supported.

[BS] RISK CATEGORY. A categorization of buildings and
other structures for determination of flood, wind, snow, ice
and earthquake /oads based on the risk associated with unac-
ceptable performance.

[BS] RISK-TARGETED MAXIMUM CONSIDERED
EARTHQUAKE (MCE,)  GROUND MOTION
RESPONSE ACCELERATIONS. The most severe earth-
quake effects considered by this code, determined for the ori-
entation that results in the largest maximum response to
horizontal ground motions and with adjustment for targeted
risk.

[BS] ROOF ASSEMBLY (For application to Chapter 15
only). A system designed to provide weather protection and
resistance to design /oads. The system consists of a roof cov-
ering and roof deck or a single component serving as both the
roof covering and the roof deck. A roof assembly can include
an underlayment, a thermal barrier, insulation or a vapor
retarder.

[BS] ROOF COATING. A fluid-applied, adhered coating
used for roof maintenance or roof repair, or as a component
of a roof covering system or roof assembly.

[BS] ROOF COVERING. The covering applied to the roof
deck for weather resistance, fire classification or appearance.

ROOF COVERING SYSTEM. See “Roof assembly.”

[BS] ROOF DECK. The flat or sloped surface constructed
on top of the exterior walls of a building or other supports for
the purpose of enclosing the story below, or sheltering an
area, to protect it from the elements, not including its support-
ing members or vertical supports.

ROOF DRAINAGE, POSITIVE. See “Positive roof drain-

2

age.

25




DEFINITIONS

[BS] ROOF RECOVER. The process of installing an addi-
tional roof covering over a prepared existing roof covering
without removing the existing roof covering.

[BS] ROOF REPAIR. Reconstruction or renewal of any part
of an existing roof for the purposes of correcting damage or
restoring pre-damage condition.

[BS] ROOF REPLACEMENT. The process of removing
the existing roof covering, repairing any damaged substrate
and installing a new roof covering.

[BG] ROOF VENTILATION. The natural or mechanical
process of supplying conditioned or unconditioned air to, or
removing such air from, attics, cathedral ceilings or other
enclosed spaces over which a roof assembly is installed.

[BG] ROOFTOP STRUCTURE. A structure erected on top
of the roof deck or on top of any part of a building.

ROOMING HOUSE. A building arranged or used for single
occupancy where no meals or personal or financial services
are provided to the residents. For the purposes of applying
this definition, personal services shall mean, any services per-
mitted or required to be furnished by an owner or operator to
a resident, other than shelter, including but not limited to,
meals or other food services, and assistance in dressing, bath-
ing or attending to other personal needs.

[BS] RUNNING BOND. The placement of masonry units
such that head joints in successive courses are horizontally
offset at least one-quarter the unit length.

[BG] SALLYPORT. A security vestibule with two or more
doors or gates where the intended purpose is to prevent con-
tinuous and unobstructed passage by allowing the release of
only one door or gate at a time.

[BE] SCISSOR STAIRWAY. Two interlocking stairways
providing two separate paths of egress located within one exit
enclosure.

[BS] SCUPPER. An opening in a wall or parapet that allows
water to drain from a roof.

[BG] SECONDARY MEMBERS. The following structural
members shall be considered secondary members and not
part of the primary structural frame:

1. Structural members not having direct connections to
the columns.

2. Members of the floor construction and roof construc-
tion not having direct connections to the columns.

3. Bracing members other than those that are part of the
primary structural frame.
[BS] SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY. A classification

assigned to a structure based on its risk category and the
severity of the design earthquake ground motion at the site.

[BS] SEISMIC FORCE-RESISTING SYSTEM. That part
of the structural system that has been considered in the design
to provide the required resistance to the prescribed seismic
forces.

[BF] SELF-CLOSING. As applied to a fire door or other
opening protective, means equipped with an device that will
ensure closing after having been opened.

26

[BE] SELF-LUMINOUS. Illuminated by a self-contained
power source, other than batteries, and operated inde-
pendently of external power sources.

[BG] SELF-SERVICE STORAGE FACILITY. Real prop-
erty designed and used for the purpose of renting or leasing
individual storage spaces to customers for the purpose of stor-
ing and removing personal property on a self-service basis.

[F] SERVICE CORRIDOR. A fully enclosed passage used
for transporting HPM and purposes other than required
means of egress.

[BE] SERVICE ENTRANCE. An entrance intended pri-
marily for delivery of goods or services.

[BF] SHAFT. An enclosed space extending through one or
more stories of a building, connecting vertical openings in
successive floors, or floors and roof.

[BF] SHAFT ENCLOSURE. The walls or construction
forming the boundaries of a shaft.

[BS] SHALLOW FOUNDATION. A shallow foundation is
an individual or strip footing, a mat foundation, a slab-on-
grade foundation or a similar foundation element.

[BS] SHEAR WALL (for Chapter 23). A wall designed to
resist lateral forces parallel to the plane of a wall.
Shear wall, perforated. A wood structural panel sheathed
wall with openings, that has not been specifically designed
and detailed for force transfer around openings.

Shear wall segment, perforated. A section of shear wall
with full-height sheathing that meets the height-to-width
ratio limits of Section 4.3.4 of AWC SDPWS.

[BS] SHINGLE FASHION. A method of installing roof or
wall coverings, water-resistive barriers, flashing or other
building components such that upper layers of material are
placed overlapping lower layers of material to provide for
drainage via gravity and moisture control.

[BS] SINGLE-PLY MEMBRANE. A roofing membrane
that is field applied using one layer of membrane material
(either homogeneous or composite) rather than multiple lay-
ers.

SINGLE RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCY. A building
arranged or used for individual nontransient residency by per-
sons living independently of one another, regardless of
whether the residents share the use of common facilities, such
as kitchen or bathing facilities.

[F] SINGLE-STATION SMOKE ALARM. An assembly
incorporating the detector, the control equipment and the
alarm-sounding device in one unit, operated from a power
supply either in the unit or obtained at the point of installa-
tion.

[BG] SITE. A parcel of land bounded by a /ot line or a desig-
nated portion of a public right-of-way.

[BS] SITE CLASS. A classification assigned to a site based
on the types of soils present and their engineering properties
as defined in Section 1613.2.2.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



310.2 Residential Group R-1. Residential Group R-1 occu-
pancies containing sleeping units where the occupants are
primarily transient, including:
Hotels
‘ ‘ Motels
Vacation timeshare properties

310.3 Residential Group R-2. Residential Group R-2 occu-
pancies containing sleeping units or more than two dwelling
units where the occupants are primarily permanent, includ-
ing:

Apartment houses

Convents

Dormitories

Fraternities and sororities

Live/work units

Monasteries
| Rooming houses with more than 5 occupants

310.4 Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3 occu-
pancies where the occupants are primarily permanent and not
classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4 or I, including:

Alcohol and drug treatment houses with five or fewer
residents

Boarding houses with five or fewer occupants

Buildings that do not contain more than two dwelling units

Care facilities that provide accommodations for five or
fewer persons receiving care

Detached one- and two-family dwellings greater than three
stories in height, multiple single-family townhouses
greater than three stories in height, attached two-family
dwellings separated from adjacent units by firewalls,
and other one- and two-family dwellings that are outside
the scope of the one- and two-family dwelling subcode

Group homes with five or fewer occupants in accordance
with Section 308.2.4

Rooming houses with five or fewer occupants

Single residential occupancies, accessory to a dwelling
unit, having no more than five roomers or lodgers
(Single occupancies, accessory to a dwelling unit, having
more than five roomers or lodgers shall be classified as
Group R-2 or I-1, as appropriate.)

310.4.1 Care facilities within a dwelling. Deleted.

310.4.2 Lodging houses. Deleted.

310.5 Residential Group R-4. Residential Group R-4 occu-
pancy shall include buildings, structures or portions thereof
for more than five but not more than 16 persons, excluding
staff, who reside on a 24-hour basis in a supervised residen-
tial environment, receive custodial care and are capable of

| | slow evacuation. Buildings of Group R-4 shall be classified
as one of the occupancy conditions specified in Section
310.5.1 or 310.5.2. This group shall include, but not be lim-
ited to, the following:

Alcohol and drug treatment centers
| | Boarding houses
Group homes
Halfway houses
Residential board and care facilities
Social rehabilitation facilities

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION AND USE

Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for
construction as defined for Group R-3, except as otherwise
provided for in this code.

310.5.1 Condition 1. This occupancy condition shall
include buildings in which all persons receiving custodial
care, without any assistance, are capable of responding to
an emergency situation to complete building evacuation.

310.5.2 Condition 2. This occupancy condition shall
include buildings in which there are any persons receiving
custodial care who require limited verbal or physical assis-
tance while responding to an emergency situation to com-
plete building evacuation.

310.6 Residential Group R-5. Residential Group R-5 occu-
pancies shall include all detached one- and two-family dwell-
ings not more than three stories in height with a separate
means of egress and multiple single-family townhouses not
more than three stories in height with a separate means of
egress designed and constructed in accordance with the Inter-
national Residential Code. This Group shall also include:

Care facilities that provide accommodations for five or
fewer persons receiving care

Group Homes with five or fewer occupants in accordance
with Section 308.2.4

Rooming houses with five or fewer residents.

Single residential occupancies, accessory to a dwelling
unit, having no more than five roomers or lodgers.
(Single occupancies, accessory to a dwelling unit, having
more than five roomers or lodgers shall be classified as
Group R-2 or I-1, as appropriate.)

SECTION 311
STORAGE GROUP S

311.1 Storage Group S. Storage Group S occupancy
includes, among others, the use of a building or structure, or a
portion thereof, for storage that is not classified as a hazard-
ous occupancy.

311.1.1 Accessory storage spaces. A room or space used
for storage purposes that is accessory to another occu-
pancy shall be classified as part of that occupancy.

311.2 Moderate-hazard storage, Group S-1. Storage Group
S-1 occupancies are buildings occupied for storage uses that
are not classified as Group S-2, including, but not limited to,
storage of the following:

Aerosol products, Levels 2 and 3
Aircraft hangar (storage and repair)
Bags: cloth, burlap and paper
Bamboos and rattan

Baskets

Belting: canvas and leather

Books and paper in rolls or packs
Boots and shoes

Buttons, including cloth covered, pearl or bone
Cardboard and cardboard boxes
Clothing, woolen wearing apparel
Cordage

Dry boat storage (indoor)

Furniture

Furs

43




OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION AND USE

Glues, mucilage, pastes and size

Grains

Horns and combs, other than celluloid

Leather

Linoleum

Lumber

Motor vehicle repair garages complying with the
maximum allowable quantities of hazardous materials
listed in Table 307.1(1) (see Section 406.8)

Photo engravings

Resilient flooring

Self-service storage facility (mini-storage)

Silks

Soaps

Sugar

Tires, bulk storage of

Tobacco, cigars, cigarettes and snuff

Upholstery and mattresses

Wax candles

311.3 Low-hazard storage, Group S-2. Storage Group S-2
occupancies include, among others, buildings used for the
storage of noncombustible materials such as products on
wood pallets or in paper cartons with or without single thick-
ness divisions; or in paper wrappings. Such products are per-
mitted to have a negligible amount of plastic #7im, such as
knobs, handles or film wrapping. Group S-2 storage uses
shall include, but not be limited to, storage of the following:

Asbestos

Beverages up to and including 16-percent alcohol in
metal, glass or ceramic containers

Cement in bags

Chalk and crayons

Dairy products in nonwaxed coated paper containers

Dry cell batteries

Electrical coils

Electrical motors

Empty cans

Food products

Foods in noncombustible containers

Fresh fruits and vegetables in nonplastic trays or containers

Frozen foods

Glass

Glass bottles, empty or filled with noncombustible liquids

Gypsum board

Inert pigments

Ivory

Meats

Metal cabinets

Metal desks with plastic tops and trim

Metal parts

Metals

Mirrors

Oil-filled and other types of distribution transformers

Parking garages, open or enclosed

Porcelain and pottery

Stoves

Talc and soapstones

Washers and dryers

44

SECTION 312
UTILITY AND MISCELLANEOUS GROUP U

312.1 General. Buildings and structures of an accessory
character and miscellaneous structures not classified in any
specific occupancy shall be constructed, equipped and main-
tained to conform to the requirements of this code commen-
surate with the fire and life hazard incidental to their
occupancy. Group U shall include, but not be limited to, the
following:

Agricultural buildings

Aircraft hangars, accessory to a one- or two-family
residence (see Section 412.4)

Barns

Carports

Communication equipment structures with a gross floor
area of less than 1,500 square feet (139 m?)

Fences more than 6 feet (1829 mm) in height

Grain silos, accessory to a residential occupancy

Livestock shelters

Private garages

Retaining walls

Sheds

Stables

Tanks

Towers

312.1.1 Greenhouses. Greenhouses not classified as
another occupancy shall be classified as Use Group U.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON OCCUPANCY AND USE

SECTION 420
GROUPS I-1, |-2 Assisted Living, R-1, R-2, R-3 and R-4

420.1 General. Occupancies in Groups I-1, R-1, R-2, R-3
and R-4 shall comply with the provisions of Sections 420.1
through 420.10 and other applicable provisions of this code.

420.2 Separation walls. Walls separating dwelling units in
the same building, walls separating sleeping units in the same
building and walls separating dwelling or sleeping units from
other occupancies contiguous to them in the same building
shall be constructed as fire partitions in accordance with Sec-
tion 708.

420.3 Horizontal separation. Floor assemblies separating
dwelling units in the same buildings, floor assemblies sepa-
rating sleeping units in the same building and floor assem-
blies separating dwelling or sleeping units from other
occupancies contiguous to them in the same building shall be
constructed as horizontal assemblies in accordance with Sec-
tion 711.

[F] 420.4 Automatic sprinkler system. Group R occupan-
cies shall be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.2.8. Group I-1 occu-
pancies shall be equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.6. Quick-
response or residential automatic sprinklers shall be installed
in accordance with Section 903.3.2.

[F] 420.5 Fire alarm systems and smoke alarms. Fire alarm
systems and smoke alarms shall be provided in Group I-1, R-
1 and R-2 occupancies in accordance with Sections 907.2.6,
907.2.8 and 907.2.9, respectively. Single- or multiple-station
smoke alarms shall be provided in Groups I-1, R-2, R-3 and
R-4 in accordance with Section 907.2.10.

420.6 Smoke barriers in Group I-1, Condition 2. Smoke
barriers shall be provided in Group I-1, Condition 2 to subdi-
vide every story used by persons receiving care, treatment or
sleeping and to provide other stories with an occupant load of
50 or more persons, into not fewer than two smoke compart-
ments. Such stories shall be divided into smoke compart-
ments with an area of not more than 22,500 square feet (2092
m?) and the distance of travel from any point in a smoke com-
partment to a smoke barrier door shall not exceed 200 feet
(60 960 mm). The smoke barrier shall be in accordance with
Section 709.

420.6.1 Refuge area. Refuge areas shall be provided
within each smoke compartment. The size of the refuge
area shall accommodate the occupants and care recipients
from the adjoining smoke compartment. Where a smoke
compartment is adjoined by two or more smoke compart-
ments, the minimum area of the refuge area shall accom-
modate the largest occupant load of the adjoining
compartments. The size of the refuge area shall provide
the following:

1. Not less than 15 net square feet (1.4 m?) for each
care recipient.

2. Not less than 6 net square feet (0.56 m?) for other
occupants.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

Areas or spaces permitted to be included in the calcula-
tion of the refuge area are corridors, lounge or dining areas
and other low-hazard areas.

420.7 Group I-2 assisted living housing units. In Group I-2
occupancies, where a fire-resistance corridor is provided in
areas where assisted living residents are housed, shared living
spaces, group meeting or multipurpose therapeutic spaces
open to the corridor shall be in accordance with all of the fol-
lowing criteria:

1. The walls and ceilings of the space are constructed as
required for corridors.

2. The spaces are not occupied as resident sleeping rooms,
treatment rooms, incidental uses in accordance with
Section 509, or hazardous uses.

3. The open space is protected by an automatic fire detec-
tion system installed in accordance with Section 907.

4. Deleted.

5. In Group I-2, Condition 1, the corridors onto which the
spaces open, in the same smoke compartment, are pro-
tected by an automatic fire detection system installed in
accordance with Section 907, or the smoke compart-
ment in which the spaces are located is equipped
throughout with quick-response sprinklers in accor-
dance with Section 903.3.2.

6. The space is arranged so as not to obstruct access to the
required exits.

420.8 Group I-1 cooking facilities. In Group I-1 occupan-
cies, rooms or spaces that contain cooking facilities with
domestic cooking appliances shall be in accordance with all
of the following criteria:

1. In Group I-1, Condition 1 occupancies, the number of
care recipients served by one cooking facility shall not
be greater than 30.

2. In Group I-1, Condition 2 occupancies, the number of
care recipients served by one cooking facility and
within the same smoke compartment shall not be
greater than 30.

3. The types of domestic cooking appliances permitted
shall be limited to ovens, cooktops, ranges, warmers
and microwaves.

4. The space containing the domestic cooking facilities
shall be arranged so as not to obstruct access to the
required exit.

5. Domestic cooking hoods installed and constructed in
accordance with Section 505 of the International
Mechanical Code shall be provided over cooktops or
ranges.

6. Cooktops and ranges shall be protected in accordance
with Section 904.13.

7. A shutoff for the fuel and electrical supply to the cook-
ing equipment shall be provided in a location that is
accessible only to staff.

85




SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON OCCUPANCY AND USE

8. A timer shall be provided that automatically deactivates
the cooking appliances within a period of not more than
120 minutes.

9. A portable fire extinguisher shall be provided. Installa-
tion shall be in accordance with Section 906 and the
extinguisher shall be located within a 30-foot (9144
mm) distance of travel from each domestic cooking
appliance.

420.8.1 Cooking facilities open to the corridor. Cooking
facilities located in a room or space open to a corridor,
aisle or common space shall comply with Section 420.8.

420.9 Group R cooking facilities. In Group R occupancies,
cooking appliances used for domestic cooking operations
shall be in accordance with Section 917.2 of the International
Mechanical Code.

420.10 Group R-2 dormitory cooking facilities. Domestic
cooking appliances for use by residents of Group R-2 college
dormitories shall be in accordance with Sections 420.10.1
and 420.10.2.

420.10.1 Cooking appliances. Where located in Group R-2
college dormitories, domestic cooking appliances for use by
residents shall be in compliance with all of the following:

1. The types of domestic cooking appliances shall be
limited to ovens, cooktops, ranges, warmers, coffee
makers and microwaves.

2. Domestic cooking appliances shall be limited to
approved locations.

3. Cooktops and ranges shall be protected in accor-
dance with Section 904.13.

4. Cooktops and ranges shall be provided with a
domestic cooking hood installed and constructed in
accordance with Section 505 of the International
Mechanical Code.

420.10.2 Cooking appliances in sleeping rooms. Cook-
tops, ranges and ovens shall not be installed or used in
sleeping rooms.

SECTION 421
HYDROGEN FUEL GAS ROOMS

[F] 421.1 General. Where required by the International Fire
Code, hydrogen fuel gas rooms shall be designed and con-
| structed in accordance with Sections 421.1 through 421.7.

[F] 421.2 Location. Hydrogen fuel gas rooms shall not be
located below grade.

[F] 421.3 Design and construction. Hydrogen fuel gas
rooms not classified as Group H shall be separated from other
areas of the building in accordance with Section 509.1.

[F] 421.3.1 Pressure control. Hydrogen fuel gas rooms
shall be provided with a ventilation system designed to
maintain the room at a negative pressure in relation to sur-
rounding rooms and spaces.

[F] 421.3.2 Windows. Operable windows in interior walls
shall not be permitted. Fixed windows shall be permitted
where in accordance with Section 716.

86

[F] 421.4 Exhaust ventilation. Hydrogen fuel gas rooms
shall be provided with mechanical exhaust ventilation in
accordance with the applicable provisions of Section
502.16.1 of the International Mechanical Code.

[F] 421.5 Gas detection system. Hydrogen fuel gas rooms
shall be provided with a gas detection system that complies
with Sections 421.5.1,421.5.2, and 916.

[F] 421.5.1 System activation. Activation of a gas detec-
tion alarm shall result in both of the following:

1. Initiation of distinct audible and visible alarm sig-
nals both inside and outside of the hydrogen fuel gas
room.

2. Automatic activation of the mechanical exhaust ven-
tilation system.

[F] 421.5.2 Failure of the gas detection system. Failure
of the gas detection system shall automatically activate the
mechanical exhaust ventilation system, stop hydrogen
generation, and cause a trouble signal to sound at an
approved location.

[F] 421.6 Explosion control. Explosion control shall be pro-
vided where required by Section 414.5.1.

[F] 421.7 Standby power. Mechanical ventilation and gas
detection systems shall be provided with a standby power
system in accordance with Section 2702.

SECTION 422
AMBULATORY CARE FACIILITIES

422.1 General. Occupancies classified as ambulatory care
facilities shall comply with the provisions of Sections 422.1
through 422.6 and other applicable provisions of this code.

422.2 Separation. Ambulatory care facilities where the
potential for four or more care recipients are of  impractical
evacuation shall be separated from adjacent

spaces, corridors or tenants with a fire partition installed

in accordance with Section 708.

422.3 Smoke compartments. Where the aggregate area of
one or more ambulatory care facilities is greater than 10,000
square feet (929 m?) on one story, the story shall be provided
with a smoke barrier to subdivide the sfory into not fewer
than two smoke compartments. The area of any one such
smoke compartment shall be not greater than 22,500 square
feet (2090 m*). The distance of travel from any point in a
smoke compartment to a smoke barrier door shall be not
greater than 200 feet (60 960 mm). The smoke barrier shall
be installed in accordance with Section 709 with the excep-
tion that smoke barriers shall be continuous from outside
wall to an outside wall, a floor to a floor, or from a smoke
barrier to a smoke barrier or a combination thereof.

422.3.1 Means of egress. Where ambulatory care facili-
ties require smoke compartmentation in accordance with
Section 422.3, the fire safety evacuation plans provided in
accordance with Section 1002.2 shall identify the building
components necessary to support a defend-in-place emer-
gency response in accordance with Sections 403 and 404
of the International Fire Code.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION




exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115
m?).

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or
more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a
level of exit discharge serving such occupancies.

[F] 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler sys-
tem shall be provided throughout stories containing
Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from
the Group A-4 occupancy to and including the levels of
exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115
m?).

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or
more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a
level of exit discharge serving such occupancies.

[F] 903.2.1.5 Group A-5. An automatic sprinkler sys-
tem shall be provided for all enclosed Group A-5 acces-
sory use areas in excess of 1,000 square feet (93 m?).

[F] 903.2.1.5.1 Spaces under grandstands or
bleachers. Enclosed spaces under grandstands or
bleachers shall be equipped with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1 where either of the following exist:

1. The enclosed area is 1,000 square feet (93 m?)
or less and is not constructed in accordance
with Section 1029.1.1.1.

2. The enclosed area exceeds 1,000 square feet

(93 m?).
[F] 903.2.1.6 Assembly occupancies on roofs. Where
an occupied roof has an assembly occupancy with an
occupant load exceeding 100 for Group A-2 and 300
for other Group A occupancies, all floors between the
occupied roof and the level of exit discharge shall be

equipped with an automatic sprinkler system in accor-
dance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

Exception: Open parking garages of Type I or Type
II construction.

903.2.1.7 Multiple fire areas. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided where multiple fire areas of
Group A-1, A-2, A-3 or A-4 occupancies share exit or
exit access components and the combined occupant
load of theses fire areas is 300 or more.

[F] 903.2.2 Ambulatory care facilities. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the entire
floor containing an ambulatory care facility where either
of the following conditions exist at any time:

1. Evacuation is impractical for four or more care
recipients.
2. Evacuation is impractical for one or more care

recipients Jocated at other than the level
of exit discharge serving such a facility.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS

In buildings where ambulatory care is provided on lev-
els other than the level of exit discharge, an automatic
sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the entire
floor as well as all floors below where such care is pro-
vided, and all floors between the level of ambulatory care
and the nearest level of exit discharge, the level of exit dis-
charge, and all floors below the level of exit discharge.

Exception: Floors classified as an open parking garage
are not required to be sprinklered.

[F] 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided for Group E occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than
12,000 square feet (1115 m?) in area.

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than
a level of exit discharge serving such occupancies.

Exception: In buildings where every classroom
has not fewer than one exterior exit door at
ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not
required in any area below the lowest level of exit
discharge serving that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300
or more.

[F] 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a
Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following condi-
tions exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet
(1115 m?).

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three sto-
ries above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all
floors, including any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000
square feet (2230 m?).

4. A Group F-1 occupancy used for the manufacture of
upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 2,500
square feet (232 m?).

[F] 903.2.4.1 Woodworking operations. An auto-
matic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
Group F-1 occupancy fire areas that contain wood-
working operations in excess of 2,500 square feet (232
m?) in area that generate finely divided combustible
waste or use finely divided combustible materials.

[F] 903.2.5 Group H. Automatic sprinkler systems shall
be provided in high-hazard occupancies as required in
Sections 903.2.5.1 through 903.2.5.3.

[F] 903.2.5.1 General. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed in Group H occupancies.

[F] 903.2.5.2 Group H-5 occupancies. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be installed throughout buildings
containing Group H-5 occupancies. The design of the
sprinkler system shall be not less than that required by
this code for the occupancy hazard classifications in
accordance with Table 903.2.5.2.

Where the design area of the sprinkler system con-
sists of a corridor protected by one row of sprinklers,
the maximum number of sprinklers required to be cal-
culated is 13.

[F] 903.2.5.3 Pyroxylin plastics. An automatic sprin-
kler system shall be provided in buildings, or portions

205




FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS

thereof, where cellulose nitrate film or pyroxylin plas-
tics are manufactured, stored or handled in quantities
exceeding 100 pounds (45 kg).

[F] 903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3 shall be pro-
vided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area.

[F] TABLE 903.2.5.2
GROUP H-5 SPRINKLER DESIGN CRITERIA

LOCATION O CLASSIFICATION
Fabrication areas Ordinary Hazard Group 2
Service corridors Ordinary Hazard Group 2
Storage rooms without dispensing Ordinary Hazard Group 2
Storage rooms with dispensing Extra Hazard Group 2
Corridors Ordinary Hazard Group 2

[F] 903.2.8.1 Group R-3. An automatic sprinkler sys-
tem installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3 shall
be permitted in Group R-3 occupancies.

[F] 903.2.8.2 Group R-4, Condition 1. An automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.3 shall be permitted in Group R-4, Condition 1
occupancies.

[F] 903.2.8.3 Group R-4, Condition 2. An automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section

[F] 903.2.6 Group 1. An automatic sprinkler system shall
be provided throughout buildings with a Group I fire area.

Exceptions:

1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accor-
dance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be permitted
in Group I-1, Condition 1 facilities.

2. For other than buildings of construction Type
HIB or VB, an automatic sprinkler system is not
required where Group 1-4 day care facilities are at
the level of exit discharge that accommodate 100
or fewer persons, and where every room where
care is provided has not fewer than one exterior
exit door.

3. In buildings where Group I-4 day care is pro-
vided on levels other than the level of exit dis-
charge, an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 shall be
installed on the entire floor where care is pro-
vided, all floors between the level of care and the
level of exit discharge, and all floors below the
level of exit discharge other than areas classified
as an open parking garage.

[F] 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout buildings containing a Group
M occupancy where one of the following conditions
exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet
(1115 m?).

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three sto-
ries above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all
floors, including any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000
square feet (2230 m?).

4. A Group M occupancy used for the display and sale
of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 5,000
square feet (464 m?).

[F] 903.2.7.1 High-piled storage. An automatic sprin-
kler system shall be provided in accordance with the
International Fire Code in all buildings of Group M
where storage of merchandise is in high-piled or rack
storage arrays.

903.3.1.2 shall be permitted in Group R-4, Condition 2
occupancies.

[F] 903.2.8.4 Care facilities. An automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3
shall be permitted in care facilities with five or fewer
individuals in a single-family dwelling.
[F] 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a
Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following condi-
tions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet
(1115 m?).

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three sto-
ries above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all
floors, including any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000
square feet (2230 m?).

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of com-
mercial motor vehicles where the fire area exceeds
5,000 square feet (464 m?).

5. A Group S-1 occupancy used for the storage of
upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 2,500
square feet (232 m?).

[F] 903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout all buildings used
as repair garages in accordance with Section 406, as
shown:

1. Buildings having two or more stories above
grade plane, including basements, with a fire
area containing a repair garage exceeding 10,000
square feet (929 m?).

2. Buildings not more than one story above grade
plane, with a fire area containing a repair garage
exceeding 12,000 square feet (1115 m?).

3. Buildings with repair garages servicing vehicles
parked in basements.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the repair of com-
mercial motor vehicles where the fire area
exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m?).

[F] 903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. Buildings and

structures where the area for the storage of tires
exceeds 20,000 cubic feet (566 m®) shall be equipped

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



exceeding 40 pounds (18 kg) shall be installed so that their
tops are not more than 5 feet (1524 mm) above the floor.

[F] 906.9.2 Extinguishers weighing more than 40
pounds. Hand-held portable fire extinguishers having a
gross weight exceeding 40 pounds (18 kg) shall be
installed so that their tops are not more than 3.5 feet (1067
mm) above the floor.

[F] 906.9.3 Floor clearance. The clearance between the
floor and the bottom of installed hand-held portable fire
extinguishers shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm).

[F] 906.10 Wheeled units. Wheeled fire extinguishers shall
be conspicuously located in a designated location.

SECTION 907
FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS

[F] 907.1 General. This section covers the application,
installation, performance and maintenance of fire alarm sys-
tems and their components.

[F] 907.1.1 Construction documents. Construction docu-
ments for fire alarm systems shall be of sufficient clarity to
indicate the location, nature and extent of the work pro-
posed and show in detail that it will conform to the provi-
sions of this code, and the International Fire Code.
907.1.2 Fire alarm shop drawings. Shop drawings for
fire alarm systems shall be submitted for review and
approval prior to system installation, and shall include, but
not be limited to, all of the following where applicable to
the system being installed:

1. A floor plan that indicates the use of all rooms.
2. Locations of alarm-initiating devices.

3. Locations of alarm notification appliances, includ-
ing candela ratings for visible alarm notification
appliances.

4. Design minimum audibility level for occupant
notification.

5. Location of fire alarm control unit, transponders
and notification power supplies.

Annunciators.

Power connection.
Battery calculations.
Conductor type and sizes.
Voltage drop calculations.

=9 0 ® N

[ —

Manufacturers’ data sheets indicating model num-
bers and listing information for equipment,
devices and materials.

12. Details of ceiling height and construction.
13. The interface of fire safety control functions.
14. Classification of the supervising station.

[F] 907.1.3 Equipment. Systems and components shall be
listed and approved for the purpose for which they are
installed.

[F] 907.2 Where required—new buildings and structures.
An approved fire alarm system installed in accordance with

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS

the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in
new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections
907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and provide occupant notification
in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements
are provided by another section of this code.

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be pro-
vided in an approved location to initiate a fire alarm signal
for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or
waterflow detection devices. Where other sections of this
code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due to sprinklers, a
single fire alarm box shall be installed.

Exceptions:

1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire
alarm systems dedicated to elevator recall control
and supervisory service.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group
R-2 occupancies unless required by the fire protec-
tion subcode official to provide a means for fire
watch personnel to initiate an alarm during a sprin-
kler system impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area
that is open to the public.

[F] 907.2.1 Group A. A manual fire alarm system that
activates the occupant notification system in accordance
with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group A occupan-
cies where the occupant load due to the assembly occu-
pancy is 300 or more, or where the Group A occupant load
is more than 100 persons above or below the lowest level
of exit discharge. Group A occupancies not separated
from one another in accordance with Section 707.3.10
shall be considered as a single occupancy for the purposes
of applying this section. Portions of Group E occupancies
occupied for assembly purposes shall be provided with a
fire alarm system as required for the Group E occupancy.

Exception: Manual fire alarm boxes are not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appli-
ances will activate throughout the notification zones
upon sprinkler water flow.

[F] 907.2.1.1 System initiation in Group A occupan-
cies with an occupant load of 1,000 or more. Activa-
tion of the fire alarm in Group A occupancies with an
occupant load of 1,000 or more shall initiate a signal
using an emergency voice/alarm communications sys-
tem in accordance with Section 907.5.2.2.

Exception: Where approved, the prerecorded
announcement is allowed to be manually deacti-
vated for a period of time, not to exceed 3 minutes,
for the sole purpose of allowing a live voice
announcement from an approved, constantly
attended location.

907.2.1.2 Group A-2 nightclubs. An automatic fire
detection system shall be installed throughout all Group
A-2 nightclubs with an occupant load of 100 or more. If
the alarm is activated by smoke detectors, it shall be
activated by either two cross-zoned smoke detectors

219



FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS

within a single protected area or a single smoke detec-
tor monitored by an alarm verification zone or an
approved equivalent method and the smoke detectors
shall be of a type designed to reduce the possibility of
false notifications based on the conditions present in
the area protected. The automatic fire detection system
shall be tied to the performance sound system and to
the house lights in such a way that activation of the fire
detection system mutes the performance sound system
and restores the intensity of illumination to that
required by Section 1008.2.

Exception: Automatic fire detection systems are not
required in buildings provided with an automatic
sprinkler system throughout.

[F] 907.2.1.3 Emergency voice/alarm communica-
tion captions. Stadiums, arenas and grandstands
required to caption audible public announcements shall
be in accordance with Section 907.5.2.2.4.

[F] 907.2.2 Group B. A manual fire alarm system shall be
installed in Group B occupancies where one of the follow-
ing conditions exists:

1. The combined Group B occupant load of all floors
is 500 or more.

2. The Group B occupant load is more than 100 per-
sons above or below the lowest level of exit dis-
charge.

3. The fire area contains an ambulatory care facility.

Exception: Manual fire alarm boxes are not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appli-
ances will activate throughout the notification zones
upon sprinkler water flow.

[F] 907.2.2.1 Ambulatory care facilities. Fire areas
containing ambulatory care facilities shall be provided
with an electronically supervised automatic smoke
detection system installed within the ambulatory care
facility and in public use areas outside of tenant spaces,
including public corridors and elevator lobbies.

Exception: Buildings equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Sec-
tion 903.3.1.1, provided that the occupant notifica-
tion appliances will activate throughout the
notification zones upon sprinkler waterflow.

[F] 907.2.3 Group E. A manual fire alarm system that ini-
tiates the occupant notification signal utilizing an emer-
gency voice/alarm communication system meeting the
requirements of Section 907.5.2.2 and installed in accor-
dance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group E
occupancies. Where automatic sprinkler systems or smoke
detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall be
connected to the building fire alarm system.

Exceptions:

1. A manual fire alarm system is not required in
Group E occupancies with an occupant load of
50 or less.

220

2. Emergency voice/alarm communication systems
meeting the requirements of Section 907.5.2.2
and installed in accordance with Section 907.6
shall not be required in Group E occupancies
with occupant loads of 100 or less, provided that
activation of the manual fire alarm system initi-
ates an approved occupant notification signal in
accordance with Section 907.5.

3. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required in
Group E occupancies where all of the following
apply:

3.1. Interior corridors are protected by smoke
detectors with alarm verification.

3.2. Auditoriums, cafeterias, gymnasiums and
similar areas are protected by heat detec-
tors or other approved detection devices.

3.3. Shops and laboratories involving dusts or
vapors are protected by heat detectors or
other approved detection devices.

4. Manual fire alarm boxes shall not be required in
Group E occupancies where all of the following
apply:

4.1. The building is equipped throughout with
an approved automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1.

4.2. The emergency voice/alarm communica-
tion system will activate on sprinkler
waterflow.

4.3. Manual activation is provided from a nor-
mally occupied location.

[F] 907.2.4 Group F. A manual fire alarm system that
activates the occupant notification system in accordance
with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group F occupan-
cies where both of the following conditions exist:

1. The Group F occupancy is two or more stories in
height.

2. The Group F occupancy has a combined occupant
load of 500 or more above or below the lowest level
of exit discharge.

Exception: Manual fire alarm boxes are not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appli-
ances will activate throughout the notification zones
upon sprinkler water flow.

[F] 907.2.5 Group H. A manual fire alarm system that
activates the occupant notification system in accordance
with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group H-5 occu-
pancies and in occupancies used for the manufacture of
organic coatings. An automatic smoke detection system
shall be installed for highly toxic gases, organic peroxides
and oxidizers in accordance with Chapters 60, 62 and 63,
respectively, of the International Fire Code.

[F] 907.2.6 Group I. A manual fire alarm system that acti-
vates the occupant notification system in accordance with

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



1005.6 Egress convergence. Where the means of egress
from stories above and below converge at an intermediate
level, the capacity of the means of egress from the point of
convergence shall be not less than the largest minimum width
or the sum of the required capacities for the stairways or
ramps serving the two adjacent stories, whichever is larger.

1005.7 Encroachment. Encroachments into the required
means of egress width shall be in accordance with the provi-
sions of this section.

1005.7.1 Doors. Doors, when fully opened, shall not
reduce the required width by more than 7 inches (178
mm). Doors in any position shall not reduce the required
width by more than one-half.

Exceptions:

1. Surface-mounted latch release hardware shall be
exempt from inclusion in the 7-inch maximum
(178 mm) encroachment where both of the fol-
lowing conditions exist:

1.1. The hardware is mounted to the side of
the door facing away from the adjacent
wall where the door is in the open posi-
tion.

1.2. The hardware is mounted not less than 34
inches (865 mm) nor more than 48 inches
(1219 mm) above the finished floor.

2. The restrictions on door swing shall not apply to
doors within individual dwelling units and sleep-
ing units of Group R-2 occupancies and dwelling
units of Group R-3 occupancies.

1005.7.2 Other projections. Handrail projections shall be
in accordance with the provisions of Section 1014.8. Other
nonstructural projections such as trim and similar decora-
tive features shall be permitted to project into the required
width not more than 1'/, inches (38 mm) on each side.

Exception: Projections are permitted in corridors
within Group I-2 Condition 1 in accordance with Sec-
tion 407.4.3.

1005.7.3 Protruding objects. Protruding objects shall
comply with the applicable requirements of Section
1003.3.

SECTION 1006
NUMBER OF EXITS AND
EXIT ACCESS DOORWAYS

1006.1 General. The number of exits or exit access doorways
required within the means of egress system shall comply with
the provisions of Section 1006.2 for spaces, including mezza-
nines, and Section 1006.3 for stories or occupied roofs.

1006.2 Egress from spaces. Rooms, areas or spaces, includ-
ing mezzanines, within a story or basement shall be provided
with the number of exits or access to exits in accordance with
this section.

1006.2.1 Egress based on occupant load and common
path of egress travel distance. Two exits or exit access
doorways from any space shall be provided where the
design occupant load or the common path of egress travel

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

MEANS OF EGRESS

distance exceeds the values listed in Table 1006.2.1. The
cumulative occupant load from adjacent rooms, areas or
spaces shall be determined in accordance with Section
1004.2.

Exceptions:

1. The number of exits from foyers, lobbies, vesti-
bules or similar spaces need not be based on
cumulative occupant loads for areas discharging
through such spaces, but the capacity of the exits
from such spaces shall be based on applicable
cumulative occupant loads.

2. Care suites in Group I-2 occupancies complying
with Section 407.4.

1006.2.1.1 Three or more exits or exit access door-
ways. Three exits or exit access doorways shall be pro-
vided from any space with an occupant load of 501 to
1,000. Four exits or exit access doorways shall be pro-
vided from any space with an occupant load greater
than 1,000.

1006.2.2 Egress based on use. The numbers of exits or
access to exits shall be provided in the uses described in
Sections 1006.2.2.1 through 1006.2.2.6.

1006.2.2.1 Boiler, incinerator and furnace rooms.
Two exit access doorways are required in boiler, incin-
erator and furnace rooms where the area is over 500
square feet (46 m?) and any fuel-fired equipment
exceeds 400,000 British thermal units (Btu) (422 000
KJ) input capacity. Where two exit access doorways are
required, one is permitted to be a fixed ladder or an
alternating tread device. Exit access doorways shall be
separated by a horizontal distance equal to one-half the
length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of
the room.

1006.2.2.2 Refrigeration machinery rooms. Machin-
ery rooms larger than 1,000 square feet (93 m?) shall
have not less than two exits or exit access doorways.
Where two exit access doorways are required, one such
doorway is permitted to be served by a fixed ladder or
an alternating tread device. Exit access doorways shall
be separated by a horizontal distance equal to one-half
the maximum horizontal dimension of the room.

All portions of machinery rooms shall be within 150
feet (45 720 mm) of an exit or exit access doorway. An
increase in exit access travel distance is permitted in
accordance with Section 1017.1.

Exit and exit access doorways shall swing in the
direction of egress travel, regardless of the occupant
load served. Exit and exit access doorways shall be
tight fitting and self-closing.

1006.2.2.3 Refrigerated rooms or spaces. Rooms or
spaces having a floor area larger than 1,000 square feet
(93 m?), containing a refrigerant evaporator and main-
tained at a temperature below 68°F (20°C), shall have
access to not less than two exits or exit access doorways.

Exit access travel distance shall be determined as
specified in Section 1017.1, but all portions of a refrig-
erated room or space shall be within 150 feet (45 720

249




MEANS OF EGRESS

mm) of an exit or exit access doorway where such
rooms are not protected by an approved automatic
sprinkler system. Egress is allowed through adjoining
refrigerated rooms or spaces.

Exception: Where using refrigerants in quantities
limited to the amounts based on the volume set forth
in the International Mechanical Code.

1006.2.2.4 Group I-4 means of egress. Group [-4
facilities, rooms or spaces where care is provided for
more than 10 children that are 2'/, years of age or less,
shall have access to not less than two exits or exit
access doorways.

1006.2.2.5 Vehicular ramps. Vehicular ramps shall
not be considered as an exit access ramp unless pedes-
trian facilities are provided.

1006.2.2.6 Group R-4. Where Group R-4 occupancies
are permitted by Section 903.2.8 to be protected by an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.3, the exit access travel distance for
Group R-4 shall be not more than 75 feet (22 860 mm).

1006.3 Egress from stories or occupied roofs. The means of
egress system serving any story or occupied roof shall be pro-
vided with the number of separate and distinct exits or access
to exits based on the aggregate occupant load served in accor-
dance with this section. Where stairways serve more than one
story, only the occupant load of each story considered indi-

TABLE 1006.2.1

vidually shall be used in calculating the required number of
exits or access to exits serving that story.

1006.3.1 Adjacent story. The path of egress travel to an
exit shall not pass through more than one adjacent story.

Exception: The path of egress travel to an exif shall be
permitted to pass through more than one adjacent story
in any of the following:

1. In Group R-1, R-2 or R-3 occupancies, exit
access stairways and ramps connecting four sto-
ries or less serving and contained within an indi-
vidual dwelling unit, sleeping unit or live/work
unit.

2. Exit access stairways serving and contained
within a Group R-3 congregate residence or a
Group R-4 facility.

3. Exit access stairways and ramps in open parking
garages that serve only the parking garage.

4. Exit access stairways and ramps serving open-air
assembly seating complying with the exit access
travel distance requirements of Section 1029.7.

5. Exit access stairways and ramps between the bal-
cony, gallery or press box and the main assembly
floor in occupancies such as theaters, places of
religious worship, auditoriums and sports facili-
ties.

SPACES WITH ONE EXIT OR EXIT ACCESS DOORWAY

MAXIMUM EXIT ACCESS TRAVEL DISTANCE (feet)
OCCUPANCY MAZ(C')“AgMo?ggXZQNT e Sr(ifr;rélt()ler e With Sprinkler System
Occupant Load (feet)
OL <30 OL > 30

A E,M 49 75 75 75¢
B 49 100 75 100°
F 49 75 75 100°
H-1, H-2, H-3 3 NP NP 25°
H-4, H-5 10 NP NP 75°
I-1,1-2¢ 14 10 NP NP 75
I-3 10 NP NP 100°
R-1 10 NP NP 75
R-2 20 NP NP 125°
R-3° 20 NP NP 125
R-4° 20 NP NP 1258
Sf 29 100 75 100°
U 49 100 75 75°

For SI: 1 foot =304.8 mm.
NP = Not Permitted.

a. Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. See Section 903 for occupancies where
automatic sprinkler systems are permitted in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2.

m o Hh o o6 o

1006.2.2.6.

250

. Group H occupancies equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.5.
. For a room or space used for assembly purposes having fixed seating, see Section 1029.8.
. For the travel distance limitations in Group I-2, see Section 407.4.
. The common path of egress travel distance shall only apply in a Group R-3 occupancy located in a mixed occupancy building.
The length of common path of egress travel distance in a Group S-2 open parking garage shall be not more than 100 feet.
. For the travel distance limitations in Group R-4 equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3, see Section

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



CHAPTER 11

ACCESSIBILITY

User note:

About this chapter: Chapter 11 contains provisions that set forth requirements for accessibility of buildings and their associated sites and
facilities for people with physical disabilities. The fundamental philosophy of the code on the subject of accessibility is that everything is
required to be accessible. This is reflected in the basic applicability requirement (see Section 1103.1). The code’s scoping requirements then
address the conditions under which accessibility is not required in terms of exceptions to this general mandate. While the IBC contains scop-
ing provisions for accessibility (for example, what, where and how many), ICC A117.1, Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities, is the
referenced standard for the technical provisions (in other words, how). Accessibility criteria for existing buildings are addressed within the
Rehabilitation Subcode, NJAC 5:23-6. The International Residential Code® references Chapter 11 for accessibility provisions; therefore, this
chapter may be applicable to housing covered under the International Residential Code. The provisions in the I-Codes are intended to meet or
exceed the requirements in the federal accessibility requirement found in the Americans with Disabilities Act and the Fair Housing Act.

There are many accessibility issues that not only benefit people with disabilities, but also provide a tangible benefit to people without disabili-
ties. This type of requirement can be set forth in the code as generally applicable without necessarily identifying it specifically as an accessi-
bility-related issue. Such a requirement would then be considered as having been “mainstreamed.” For example, visible alarms are located in
Chapter 9 and accessible means of egress and ramp requirements are addressed in Chapter 10.

SECTION 1101
GENERAL

1101.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall control the
design and construction of facilities for accessibility for indi-
viduals with disabilities. This chapter shall be interpreted to
require access for people with disabilities, including, but not
limited to occupants, employees, consumers, students, spec-
tators, participants, or visitors.

1101.2 Existing facilities. Any building or portion of a build-
ing constructed or altered to be accessible shall be maintained
accessible.

SECTION 1102
COMPLIANCE

1102.1 Design. Buildings and facilities shall be designed and
constructed to be accessible in accordance with this code and
ICC A117.1, which is amended as follows:

1. The text at section 105.2, entitled “Documents,” shall
be amended as follows:

1.1. In Section 105.2.2.2, entitled “National Fire
Alarm Code,” delete “NFPA 72-2007” and
insert “the edition of NFPA 72 adopted by ref-
erence in this subcode;”

1.2. In Section 105.2.3, entitled “Power Assist and
Low-Energy Power-Operated Doors,” delete
“ANSI/BHMA A156.19-2007” and insert “the
edition of ANSI/BHMA A156.19 adopted by
reference in this subcode;”

1.3. In Section 105.2.4, entitled “Power-Operated
Pedestrian Doors,” delete “ANSI/BHMA
A156.10” and insert “the edition of ANSI/
BHMA A156.10 adopted by reference in this
subcode;”

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

1.4

L.5.

. In Section 105.2.5, entitled “Safety Code for
Elevators and Escalators,” delete “ASME/ANSI
A17.1-2007/CSA B44-07” and insert “the edi-
tion of ASME/ANSI A17.1/CSA B44 adopted
by reference in this subcode;” and

In Section 105.2.6, entitled “Safety Standard for
Platform Lifts and Stairway Chairlifts,” delete
“ASME/ANSI A18.1-2005” and insert “ASME/
ANSI A18.1 adopted by reference in this sub-
code.”

2. In Section 106.5, delete the definition of “Administra-
tive Authority;”

3. Delete Chapter 2, “Scoping;”

4. Section 410.2 shall be deleted in its entirety and the
following language from the 2003 edition of ICC
A117.1-2003 shall be inserted:

410.2 Lift entry. Lifts with doors or gates shall
comply with Section 410.2.1. Lifts with ramps shall
comply with Section 410.2.2.

410.2.1 Doors and gates. Doors and gates shall
be low-energy power-operated doors or gates
complying with Section 404.3. Doors shall
remain open for 20 seconds minimum. End door
clear opening width shall be 32 inches (815 mm)
minimum. Side door clear opening width shall be
42 inches (1065) minimum.
Exception: Lifts serving two landings maxi-
mum and having doors or gates on opposite
sides shall be permitted to have self-closing
manual doors or gates.
410.2.2 Ramps. End ramps shall be 32 inches
(815 mm) minimum in width. Side ramps shall be
42 inches (1065 mm) minimum in width.

291




ACCESSIBILITY

5. In Section 410.5.2, Lifts with Doors on Adjacent
Sides, the Exception shall be amended to add the fol-
lowing phrase after the words “in existing buildings,”
“where technically infeasible to provide the door
arrangement prescribed by Section 410.5.2.”

6. Delete Section 607.8, entitled “Water Temperature,”
in its entirety.

7. Delete Section 608.8, entitled “Water Temperature,”
in its entirety.

8. In Section 611, entitled “Washing Machines and

Clothes Dryers,” delete Section 611.3, entitled “Oper-
able parts,” and Section 611.4, entitled “Height.”

9. Sections 804.5.2, entitled “Operable Parts,” 804.5.3,
entitled “Dishwasher,” 804.5.4, entitled “Cooktop,”
804.5.5, entitled “Oven,” and 804.5.6, entitled
“Refrigerator/Freezer,” shall be deleted in their
entirety.

10. Amend Section 1002.3.1, entitled “Location,” as fol-
lows:

10.1. In the Exception, delete the word “unfinished”
in two places.

11. In Section 1002.15.2, Bed Frames, “with a minimum
of six and one-half inches (165 mm) clear from the
floor to the lowest level of the bed frame” shall be
inserted at the end of the sentence.

12. Amend Section 1003.3.1, entitled “Location,” as fol-
lows: Insert “1.” before the existing exception and
delete “unfinished” in two places. Additionally, insert
“Exception 2. An accessible route is not required to
exterior decks, patios, or balconies that have impervi-
ous or improved surfaces that are not more than 4
inches (102 mm) below the finished floor level of the
adjacent interior space of the dwelling unit.”

13. In Section 1003.9, Operable parts, Exception 2 shall
be deleted and the following shall be inserted:
“Receptacle outlets provided in a kitchen above a
length of countertop shall not be required to comply
with Section 309.”

14. Section 1003.10, Laundry equipment, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

15. Section 1003.11.2.5.2, entitled “Shower,” shall be
amended as follows:

15.1. In the first line, after the word “Exception,”
insert the number “1.”

15.2. Add the following text at the end of the
Exception: “2. The threshold for a shower
compartment may be adaptable provided the
shower threshold can be made accessible with
minimal expense and effort.”

16. In Section 1003.12.3.1, entitled “Clear Floor Space,”
delete Exception (a) in its entirety and insert in its
place: “(a) the cabinetry can be removed or replaced
as a unit.”

292

17. In Section 1003.12.3.2, entitled “Height,” delete the
exception in its entirety and insert the following in its
place: “Exception: A counter that is adjustable or
replaceable as a unit to provide a work surface at
heights between 29 inches (735 mm) minimum and
36 inches (914 mm) maximum shall be permitted.”

18. In Section 1003.12.4.1, entitled “Clear Floor Space,”
delete Exception 2 (a) in its entirety and insert in its
place: “(a) the cabinetry can be removed or replaced
as a unit.”

19. In Section 1003.12.4.2, entitled “Height,” delete the
exception in its entirety and insert the following in its
place: “Exception: A sink and counter that is adjust-
able or replaceable as a unit at heights between 29
inches (735 mm) minimum and 36 inches (914 mm)
maximum, provided rough-in plumbing permits con-
nections of supply and drain piping for sinks mounted

at heights of 29 inches (735 mm), shall be permitted.”

20. In Section 1003.12.5, entitled “Appliances,” delete
the following sections: Section 1003.12.5.1, entitled
“Operable parts;” Section 1003.12.5.3, entitled “Dish-
washer;” Section 1003.12.5.4, entitled “Cooktop;”
Section 1003.12.5.5, entitled “Oven;” and Section
1003.12.5.6, entitled “Refrigerator/Freezer.”

21. Delete Section 1004, entitled “Type B Units,” in its
entirety.

SECTION 1103
SCOPING REQUIREMENTS

1103.1 Where required. Sites, buildings, structures, facili-
ties, elements and spaces, temporary or permanent, shall be
accessible to individuals with disabilities.

1103.2 General exceptions. Sites, buildings, structures,
Jacilities, elements and spaces shall be exempt from this
chapter to the extent specified in this section.

1103.2.1 Specific requirements. Accessibility is not
required in buildings and facilities, or portions thereof, to
the extent permitted by Sections 1104 through 1111.

1103.2.2 Employee work areas. Spaces and elements
within employee work areas shall only be required to com-
ply with Sections 907.5.2.3.1, 1009 and 1104.3.1 and shall
be designed and constructed so that individuals with dis-
abilities can approach, enter and exit the work area. Work
areas, or portions of work areas, other than raised court-
room stations in accordance with Section 1108.4.1.4, that
are less than 300 square feet (30 m?) in area and located 7
inches (178 mm) or more above or below the ground or fin-
ished floor where the change in elevation is essential to the
function of the space shall be exempt from all requirements.

1103.2.3 Residential buildings or structures. The fol-
lowing residential buildings are not required to comply
with this chapter.

1103.2.3.1 Townhouses. Townhouses are not required to
comply with this chapter, except townhouses for which
credit is sought for low- and moderate-income housing
through the Council on Affordable Housing (COAH).

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION




1103.2.3.1.1 For the purposes of applying this exemp-
tion, a townhouse shall be a single dwelling unit with
two or more stories of dwelling space, exclusive of
basement or attic, where each dwelling unit extends
from foundation to roof. The dwelling unit shall have
an independent entrance that shall serve one dwelling
unit only at or near grade; most or all of the sleeping
rooms shall be on one story; and most or all of the
remaining habitable space, such as kitchen, living, and
dining areas, shall be on another story; or

1103.2.3.2 Buildings of Group R-2, R-3, R4 or R-5 with
one, two, or three dwelling units in a single structure;

1103.2.3.2.1 For the purposes of determining the
number of dwelling units in a single structure, fire
walls or party walls shall not constitute separate
buildings.

1103.2.3.2.2 Exception: Townhouses or multistory
dwelling units for which credit is sought for low- or
moderate-income housing through the Council on
Affordable Housing (COAH) and that are attached
to at least one other dwelling unit shall comply with
this chapter.

1103.2.4 Utility buildings. Group U occupancies are not
required to comply with this chapter other than the follow-
ing:
1. In agricultural buildings, access is required to paved
work areas and areas open to the general public.

2. Private garages or carports that contain required
accessible parking.

1103.2.5 Construction sites. Structures, sites and equip-
ment directly associated with the actual processes of con-
struction including, but not limited to, scaffolding,
bridging, materials hoists, materials storage or construc-
tion trailers are not required to comply with this chapter.

Exception: Construction site trailers used as sales
offices shall be accessible.

1103.2.6 Raised areas. Raised areas used primarily for
purposes of security, life safety or fire safety including,
but not limited to, observation galleries, prison guard tow-
ers, fire towers or lifeguard stands are not required to com-
ply with this chapter.

1103.2.7 Limited access spaces. Spaces accessed only by
ladders, catwalks, crawl spaces, freight elevators or very nar-
row passageways are not required to comply with this chap-
ter.

1103.2.8 Areas in places of religious worship. Raised or
lowered areas, or portions of areas, in places of religious wor-
ship that are less than 300 square feet (30 m?) in area and
located 7 inches (178 mm) or more above or below the fin-
ished floor and used primarily for the performance of reli-
gious ceremonies are not required to comply with this
chapter.

1103.2.9 Equipment spaces. Spaces frequented only by
service personnel for maintenance, repair or occasional

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

ACCESSIBILITY

monitoring of equipment are not required to comply with
this chapter.

1103.2.10 Highway tollbooths. Highway tollbooths
where the access is provided only by bridges above the
vehicular traffic or underground tunnels are not required to
comply with this chapter.

1103.2.11 Residential Group R-1. Buildings of Group R-1
containing not more than five sleeping units for rent or hire
that are also occupied as the residence of the proprietor are
not required to comply with this chapter.

1103.2.12 Day care facilities. Where a day care facility is
part of a dwelling unit, only the portion of the structure uti-
lized for the day care facility is required to comply with
this chapter.

1103.2.13 Detention and correctional facilities. In
detention and correctional facilities, common use areas
that are used only by inmates or detainees and security
personnel, and that do not serve holding cells or housing
cells required to be Accessible units, are not required to
comply with this chapter.

1103.2.14 Walk-in coolers and freezers. Walk-in cooler
and freezer equipment accessed only from employee work
areas is not required to comply with this chapter.

SECTION 1104
ACCESSIBLE ROUTE

1104.1 Site arrival points. At least one accessible route
within the site shall be provided from public transportation
stops, accessible parking, accessible passenger loading
zones, and public streets or sidewalks to the accessible build-
ing entrance served.

Exception: An accessible route shall not be required <

between site arrival points and the building or facility
entrance if the only means of access between them is a
vehicular way not providing for pedestrian access.

1104.2 Within a site. At least one accessible route shall con-
nect accessible buildings, accessible facilities, accessible ele-
ments and accessible spaces that are on the same size.

Exceptions:

1. An accessible route is not required between accessi-
ble buildings, accessible facilities, accessible ele-
ments and accessible spaces that have, as the only
means of access between them, a vehicular way not
providing for pedestrian access.

2. An accessible route to recreational facilities shall only
be required to the extent specified in Section 1110.

1104.3 Connected spaces. Where a building or portion of a
building is required to be accessible, at least one accessible
route shall be provided to each portion of the building, to
accessible building entrances connecting accessible pedes-
trian walkways and to the public way.

Exceptions:

1. Stories and mezzanines exempted by Section
1104.4.

293



ACCESSIBILITY

2. In a building, room or space used for assembly pur-
poses with fixed seating, an accessible route shall
not be required to serve levels where wheelchair
spaces are not provided.

3. Vertical access to elevated employee work stations
within a courtroom complying with Section
1108.4.1.4.

4. An accessible route to recreational facilities shall
only be required to the extent specified in Section
1110.

1104.3.1 Employee work areas. Common use circulation
paths within employee work areas shall be accessible
routes.

Exceptions:

1. Common use circulation paths, located within
employee work areas that are less than 1,000
square feet (93 m?) in size and defined by perma-
nently installed partitions, counters, casework or
furnishings, shall not be required to be accessible
routes.

2. Common use circulation paths, located within
employee work areas, that are an integral compo-
nent of equipment, shall not be required to be
accessible routes.

3. Common use circulation paths, located within
exterior employee work areas that are fully
exposed to the weather, shall not be required to
be accessible routes.

1104.3.2 Press boxes. Press boxes in a building, room or
space used for assembly purposes shall be on an accessible
route.

Exceptions:

1. An accessible route shall not be required to press
boxes in bleachers that have a single point of
entry from the bleachers, provided that the aggre-
gate area of all press boxes for each playing field
is not more than 500 square feet (46 m?).

2. An accessible route shall not be required to free-
standing press boxes that are more than 12 feet
(3660 mm) above grade provided that the aggre-
gate area of all press boxes for each playing field
is not more than 500 square feet (46 m>).

1104.4 Multilevel nonresidential buildings and multilevel
buildings of Group R-1.

1104.4.1 Small buildings. Small buildings, defined as
those with a total gross enclosed floor area of less than
10,000 square feet, shall be required to have at least one
accessible entrance on the ground (or first) floor and
accessible interior building features on all floors. Except
as provided in Sections 1104.4.1.1 — 1104.4.1.4, small
buildings that are not more than two stories shall not be
required to have an elevator(s) to provide a vertical acces-
sible route between floors. Small buildings that are three
or more stories shall be required to have an elevator(s) to
provide a vertical accessible route between floors; how-
ever, in such buildings, floors that are less than 3,000

294

square feet or floors with only mechanical equipment shall
not be required to be served by an elevator.

1104.4.1.1 Regardless of the square footage of the
buildings or floors, buildings of two or more stories
that are owned and occupied by public entities shall
provide a vertical accessible route between floors.

1104.4.1.2 Regardless of the square footage of the
buildings or floors, buildings of two or more stories
that house public transit stations or airport passenger
terminals shall provide a vertical accessible route
between floors.

1104.4.1.3 Regardless of the square footage of the
buildings or floors, buildings of two or more stories
that house the professional offices of health care pro-
viders shall provide a vertical accessible route between
floors.

1104.4.1.4 Regardless of the square footage of the
buildings or floors, buildings of two or more stories
that house shopping centers or shopping malls shall
provide a vertical accessible route between floors.

1104.4.1.4.1 For the purposes of applying this
requirement, a shopping center or shopping mall
shall mean a building or a series of buildings on a
common site, under common ownership or control,
or developed as one project or as a series of related
projects housing five or more sales or rental estab-
lishments.

1104.4.2 Large buildings. Large buildings, defined as
those with a total gross enclosed floor area of 10,000
square feet or more, shall provide the accessible building
features required of small buildings in Section 1104.4.1. In
addition, large buildings shall be required to have an
elevator(s) to provide a vertical accessible route between
floors; however, in such buildings, floors that are less than
3,000 square feet or floors with only mechanical equipment
shall not be required to be served by an elevator.

1104.4.2.1 Where facilities for employees, including
rest rooms, lunch rooms, and lockers, and public facili-
ties, including rest rooms and drinking fountains, are
provided on a floor or mezzanine that is not required to
be served by an elevator and where no vertical accessi-
ble route is provided, the facilities provided on the floor
or mezzanine must also be provided on the accessible
level.

1104.4.3 For the purposes of applying these provisions,
buildings separated by firewalls with penetrations
intended for human passage shall not constitute separate
buildings.

1104.4.4 The following provisions shall apply to a nonres-
idential building required to be accessible, whether a large
building or a small building.

1104.4.4.1 An accessible route available to the general
public shall not pass through kitchens, storage rooms,
or similar spaces.

1104.4.4.2 In buildings, facilities, or portions thereof
that primarily serve children, accessible facilities that
comply with the provisions of this subchapter for use
by adults shall be provided.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION




rooms, toilet rooms, kitchens, storage rooms and laundry
rooms shall have a ceiling height of not less than 7 feet (2134
mm) above the finished floor.

Exceptions:

1. In one- and two-family dwellings, beams or girders
spaced not less than 4 feet (1219 mm) on center
shall be permitted to project not more than 6 inches
(152 mm) below the required ceiling height.

2. If any room in a building has a sloped ceiling, the
prescribed ceiling height for the room is required in
one-half the area thereof. Any portion of the room
measuring less than 5 feet (1524 mm) from the fin-
ished floor to the ceiling shall not be included in any
computation of the minimum area thereof.

3. The height of mezzanines and spaces below mezza-
nines shall be in accordance with Section 505.2.

4. Corridors contained within a dwelling unit or sleep-
ing unit in a Group R occupancy shall have a ceiling
height of not less than 7 feet (2134 mm) above the
finished floor.

1207.2.1 Furred ceiling. Any room with a furred ceiling
shall be required to have the minimum ceiling height in
two-thirds of the area thereof, but in no case shall the
height of the furred ceiling be less than 7 feet (2134 mm).

1207.3 Room area. Every dwelling unit shall have not less
than one room that shall have not less than 120 square feet
(11.2 m?) of net floor area. Other habitable rooms shall have
a net floor area of not less than 70 square feet (6.5 m?).

Exception: Kitchens are not required to be of a minimum
floor area.

1207.4 Efficiency dwelling units. An efficiency living unit
shall conform to the requirements of the code except as mod-
ified herein:

1. The unit shall have a living room of not less than 220
square feet (20.4 m?®) of floor area. An additional 100
square feet (9.3 m?) of floor area shall be provided for
each occupant of such unit in excess of two.

2. The unit shall be provided with a separate closet.

3. The unit shall be provided with a kitchen sink, cooking
appliance and refrigeration facilities, each having a
clear working space of not less than 30 inches (762
mm) in front. Light and ventilation conforming to this
code shall be provided.

4. The unit shall be provided with a separate bathroom con-
taining a water closet, lavatory and bathtub or shower.

SECTION 1208
ACCESS TO UNOCCUPIED SPACES

1208.1 Crawl spaces. Crawl spaces shall be provided with
not less than one access opening that shall be not less than 18
inches by 24 inches (457 mm by 610 mm).

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT

1208.2 Attic spaces. An opening not less than 20 inches by
30 inches (559 mm by 762 mm) shall be provided to any
attic area having a clear height of over 30 inches (762 mm).
Clear headroom of not less than 30 inches (762 mm) shall
be provided in the attic space at or above the access open-
ing.

1208.3 Mechanical appliances. Access to mechanical appli-
ances installed in under-floor areas, in attic spaces and on
roofs or elevated structures shall be in accordance with the
International Mechanical Code.

SECTION 1209
TOILET AND BATHROOM REQUIREMENTS

[P] 1209.1 Required fixtures. The number and type of
plumbing fixtures provided in any occupancy shall comply
with the plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15).

1209.2 Finish materials. Walls, floors and partitions in toilet
and bathrooms shall comply with Sections 1209.2.1 through
1209.2.4.

1209.2.1 Floors and wall bases. In other than dwelling
units, toilet, bathing and shower room floor finish materi-
als shall have a smooth, hard, nonabsorbent surface. The
intersections of such floors with walls shall have a smooth,
hard, nonabsorbent vertical base that extends upward onto
the walls not less than 4 inches (102 mm).

1209.2.2 Walls and partitions. Walls and partitions
within 2 feet (610 mm) of service sinks, urinals and water
closets shall have a smooth, hard, nonabsorbent surface, to
a height of not less than 4 feet (1219 mm) above the floor,
and except for structural elements, the materials used in
such walls shall be of a type that is not adversely affected
by moisture.

Exception: This section does not apply to the follow-
ing buildings and spaces:

1. Dwelling units and sleeping units.

2. Toilet rooms that are not accessible to the public
and that have not more than one water closet.

Accessories such as grab bars, towel bars, paper dis-
pensers and soap dishes, provided on or within walls, shall
be installed and sealed to protect structural elements from
moisture.

1209.2.3 Showers. Shower compartments and walls above
bathtubs with installed shower heads shall be finished with
a smooth, nonabsorbent surface to a height not less than 72
inches (1829 mm) above the drain inlet.

1209.2.4 Waterproof joints. Built-in tubs with showers
shall have waterproof joints between the tub and adjacent
wall.

[P] 1209.3 Privacy. Deleted.

313



314 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION



apply. In Section 2.6.6.2 of TIA 222, the horizontal extent of
Topographic Category 2, escarpments, shall be 16 times the
height of the escarpment.

Exception: Single free-standing poles used to support
antennas not greater than 75 feet (22 860 mm), measured
from the top of the pole to grade, shall not be required to
be noncombustible.

[BS] 3108.2 Location and access. Towers shall be located
such that guy wires and other accessories shall not cross or
encroach on any street or other public space, or over above-
ground electric utility lines, or encroach on any privately
owned property without the written consent of the owner of
the encroached-upon property, space or above-ground elec-
tric utility lines. Towers shall be equipped with climbing and
working facilities in compliance with TIA-222. Access to the
tower sites shall be limited as required by applicable OSHA,
FCC and EPA regulations.

SECTION 3109
SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS

3109.1 General. The design and construction of pools, spas,
hot tubs and enclosures shall comply with the International
Swimming Pool and Spa Code listed in Chapter 35.

3109.2 Amendments to the International Swimming Pool
and Spa Code. The following amendments shall be made to
the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code:

1. Chapter 1, Scope and Administration, shall be deleted
in its entirety and “See the administrative provisions of
N.J.A.C. 5:23.” shall be inserted. In addition, any refer-
enced section of Chapter 1 shall be deleted throughout
the code and “the administrative provisions of the Uni-
form Construction Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)” shall be
inserted.

2. Chapter 2, Definitions, shall be amended as follows:

2.1. In Section 201.3, Terms defined in other
codes, “International Plumbing Code” shall
be deleted and “plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.15)” shall be inserted.

2.2. In Section 202, Definitions:

2.2.1. The definition of “alteration” shall
be deleted.

The definition of “code official”
shall be deleted and the following
shall be inserted: “Construction
Official. A  qualified person
appointed by the municipal appoint-
ing authority or the commissioner
pursuant to the act and the regula-
tions to enforce and administer the
regulations within the jurisdiction
of the enforcing agency.”

22.2.

2.2.3. The definition of “existing pool or

spa” shall be deleted.

2.2.4 The definition of “owner” shall be
deleted and the following shall be

inserted: “Owner. The owner or

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION

SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

owners in fee of the property of a
lesser estate therein, a mortgagee or
vendee in possession, an assignee of
rents, receiver, executor, trustee,
lessee or any other person, firm or
corporation, directly or indirectly in
control of a building, structure or
real property and shall include any
subdivision thereof of the State.”

2.2.5. The definitions of “permit” and

“repair” shall be deleted.

3. Chapter 3, General Compliance, shall be amended as

follows:
3.1.

3.2.

3.3.

3.4.

3.5.

3.6.

3.7.

In Section 302.1, Electrical, “or the Interna-
tional Residential Code, as applicable in
accordance with Section 102.7.1” shall be
deleted.

In Section 302.2, Water service drainage,
“International Plumbing Code” shall be
deleted and “plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.15)” shall be inserted.

In Sections 302.5, Backflow prevention, and
302.6, Waste-water discharge, “International
Plumbing Code or the International Residen-
tial Code, as applicable in accordance with
Section 102.7.1” shall be deleted and “plumb-
ing subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15)” shall be
inserted.

Section 305, Barrier requirements, shall be
amended as follows:

3.4.1. In Section 305.1, General, in the
second sentence, “and swimming
pools are equipped with a powered
safety cover that complies with
ASTM F1346” shall be deleted.
Also in the second sentence, “hot
tubs or pools” shall be replaced with
“or hot tubs”.

Section 305.4, Structure wall as a
barrier, shall be deleted.

34.2.

3.4.3. In Section 305.5, Onground resi-
dential pool structure as a barrier, in
Item 3, “capable of being secured,
locked or removed to prevent access
except where the ladder or steps

are” shall be deleted.

In Section 306.1, General, “in accordance
with Section 102.7.1” shall be deleted.

Sections 306.3, Step risers and treads, and
306.4, Deck steps handrail required, shall be
deleted.

In Section 306.9.1, Hose bibbs, “International
Plumbing Code or the International Residen-
tial Code, as applicable in accordance with
Section 102.7.1” shall be deleted and “plumb-
ing subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15)” shall be
inserted.

581




SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

3.8. In Sections 307.1.1, Glazing in hazardous
locations, 307.2.2, Materials and structural
design, 307.1.3, Roofs or canopies, 316.4,
Installation, and 316.6.1, Installation, “in
accordance with Section 102.7.1” shall be
deleted.

3.9. In Section 318.2, Protection of potable water

supply, “International Residential Code or
the International Plumbing Code or, as appli-
cable in accordance with Section 102.7.1”
shall be deleted and “plumbing subcode
(N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15)” shall be inserted.

3.10. In Section 321.4, Residential pool and deck
illumination, “or the International Residential
Code, as applicable in accordance with Sec-
tion 102.7.1” shall be deleted.

4. Chapter 4, Public swimming pools, shall be amended as
follows:

4.1. In Section 410.1, Dressing and sanitary facili-
ties, “International Plumbing Code” shall be
deleted and “plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.15)” shall be inserted.

5. Amendments to Chapter 6, Aquatic recreation facili-
ties, shall be amended as follows:

5.1. In Section 601.1, Scope, the following sen-
tence shall be added to the end of the para-
graph, “For purposes of enforcement, Class
D-2 and Class D-6 public pools shall be regu-
lated by this chapter and N.J.A.C. 5:23; all
other Class D public pools shall be regulated
by NJ.A.C. 5:144.”

5.2. In Section 609.1, General, “Section 609.2
through 609.9” shall be deleted and “the
plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15)” shall
be inserted.

5.3. Sections 609.2, Number of fixtures, 609.3,
Showers, 609.4, Soap dispensers, 609.5, Toi-
let tissue holder, 609.6, Lavatory mirror,
609.7, Sanitary napkin receptacles, 609.8,
Sanitary napkin dispensers, and 609.9, Infant
care, shall be deleted.

SECTION 3110
AUTOMATIC VEHICULAR GATES

3110.1 General. Automatic vehicular gates shall comply
with the requirements of Sections 3110.2 and 3110.3 and
other applicable sections of this code.

3110.2 Vehicular gates intended for automation. Vehicular
gates intended for automation shall be designed, constructed
and installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM
F2200.

3110.3 Vehicular gate openers. Vehicular gate openers,
where provided, shall be /isted in accordance with UL 325.

582

SECTION 3111
SOLAR ENERGY SYSTEMS

3111.1 General. Solar energy systems shall comply with the
requirements of this section.

3111.1.1 Wind resistance. Rooftop-mounted photovoltaic
panels and modules and solar thermal collectors shall be
designed in accordance with Section 1609.

3111.1.2 Roof live load. Roof structures that provide sup-
port for solar energy systems shall be designed in accor-
dance with Section 1607.13.5.

3111.2 Solar thermal systems. Solar thermal systems shall
be designed and installed in accordance with Section
2606.12, the plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15), the
International Mechanical Code and the International Fire
Code.

3111.2.1 Equipment. Solar thermal systems and compo-
nents shall be listed and labeled in accordance with ICC
900/SRCC 300 and ICC 901/SRCC 100.

3111.3 Photovoltaic solar energy systems. Photovoltaic
solar energy systems shall be designed and installed in accor-
dance with this section, the International Fire Code, NFPA
70 and the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

3111.3.1 Equipment. Photovoltaic panels and modules
shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 1703.
Inverters shall be /isted and labeled in accordance with UL
1741. Systems connected to the utility grid shall use
inverters /isted for utility interaction.

3111.3.2 Fire classification. Rooftop-mounted photovol-
taic systems shall have a fire classification in accordance
with Section 1505.9. Building-integrated photovoltaic sys-
tems shall have a fire classification in accordance with
Section 1505.8.

3111.3.3 Building-integrated photovoltaic systems.
Building-integrated photovoltaic systems that serve as
roof coverings shall be designed and installed in accor-
dance with Section 1507.18.

3111.3.4 Access and pathways. Roof access, pathways
and spacing requirements shall be provided in accordance
with Section 1204 of the International Fire Code.

3111.3.5 Ground-mounted photovoltaic systems.
Ground-mounted photovoltaic systems shall be designed
and installed in accordance with Chapter 16 and the Inter-
national Fire Code.

3111.3.5.1 Fire separation distances. Ground-
mounted photovoltaic systems shall be subject to the
fire separation distance requirements determined by the
local jurisdiction.

SECTION 3112
GREENHOUSES

3112.1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to
greenhouses that are designed and used for the cultivation,
maintenance, or protection of plants.

3112.2 Accessibility. Greenhouses shall be accessible in
accordance with Chapter 11.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, NEW JERSEY EDITION




	1209_IBC
	IBC_2018_err
	Jan_2022_IBC_err
	IBC_2018_err
	IBC_2018_err
	IBC_2018_err
	310_R_use
	IBC_2018_err
	420_IBC
	907_A2_NC
	t_1006


	pool_IBC

	1104_IBC





