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Municipal/County/
Highway Road in
Wharton (57.5 mi)
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  Wharton State Forest Visiting Vehicle Use Map

All motorized vehicles operating 
on unimproved roads must be street 
legal, registered, insured and 
operated by a licensed driver. 
Vehicles and operators are subject 
to the motor vehicle laws of the 
State of New Jersey, N.J.S.A. 
39:1-1, et seq.

Roads in Wharton State Forest 
traverse sandy and frequently 
unimproved conditions. Visitors are 
encouraged to approach roads with 
caution and check-in with the Forest 
office for current conditions.

Temporary road closures may 
occur at any time due to weather, 
maintenance or State Park Service 
operational needs. Updates will be 
posted to dep.nj.gov/wharton/.

What is hunting access?
Dotted lines identify access for 
those actively engaged in hunting. 
Hunters may access these areas 
with a legal motorized vehicle 
during an active hunting season 
with a valid New Jersey hunting 
license per Fish and Wildlife 
regulations. Hunters should be 
prepared for difficult conditions.


