
 

 

 

 

  
The Advocacy Institute Is Pleased to Announce 

 
PROGRAM ANNOUNCEMENT 

 
TRAIN THE TRAINERS 

 
September 21, 2018 

8:45 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. 
Richard J. Hughes Justice Complex 

4th Floor Conference Center: Rooms D1 & D2 
25 Market Street 

Trenton, New Jersey 
 

Program Summary 
 

This one-day program provides "learn-by-doing" training for prospective advocacy skills faculty. 
Participants will receive instruction on the AGAI’s teaching methodology and critique student 
performances in a simulated mock skills program setting.  The faculty, in turn, will then evaluate 
the participants’ teaching techniques. 

 
Who Should Attend? 

 
Attendees for this program have been nominated to participate by their division, program or 
office leadership.  Please do not attempt to register for this program if you have not been invited 
to attend.  Those who complete the program will be eligible to serve as faculty for Attorney 
General's Advocacy Institute and National Attorneys General Training and Research Institute 
litigation skills programs. 
 

Who Is the Faculty? 

DAG Joseph M. Micheletti is an Assistant Section Chief in the Litigation Practice Group,  
where he manages a group of trial attorneys.  DAG Micheletti has over twenty-two years of 
public service and a wealth of experience in all aspects of litigation.  During his time with the 
Attorney General’s Office, Joe has served in various staff and supervisory positions.   He 
currently handles the defense of complex civil rights litigations brought against law enforcement 
agencies and their employees.  DAG Micheletti previously served as a trial attorney in the 
Employment Litigation Section, where he provided representation to State agencies and 
employees in complex employment matters.  He also served in the Tort Litigation Section; where 
he litigated a high volume of personal injury cases.  DAG Micheletti has tried multiple matters 
before the New Jersey Superior and United States District Courts and has also represented State 
agencies in front of administrative bodies including the Division of Civil Rights and the Equal 



Employment Opportunity Commission.  Additionally, DAG Micheletti briefed and argued 
multiple appeals before the New Jersey Superior Court, Appellate Division and the United States 
Third Circuit Court of Appeals.  DAG Micheletti serves as a faculty member for New Jersey 
Attorney General’s Advocacy Institute and the National Attorneys General Training and 
Research Institute.  He teaches courses in trial advocacy, depositions, and Section 183 law. 

Anthony A. Picione is a Deputy Attorney General with the Division of Criminal Justice and the 
Chief of the Division's Corruption Bureau.  Mr. Picione=s practice concentrates largely on white 
collar crime, particularly offenses involving public officials and public funds.  During his career, 
Mr. Picione has prosecuted numerous high profile cases involving public corruption and the theft 
of public funds.  Mr. Picione is also an instructor for the New Jersey Attorney General=s 
Advocacy Institute, the Police Training Commission and the National Attorneys General 
Training and Research Institute, as well as an Adjunct Professor of Trial Advocacy for Rutgers 
Law School - Camden. Mr. Picione received his J.D. cum laude from the University of 
Pennsylvania Law School in 1995 and received his B.A. magna cum laude from Drew University 
in 1992. 

CLE Credit 
 

NJ CLE Credit:  This program has been approved by the Board on Continuing Legal Education 
of the Supreme Court of New Jersey for 6.0 hours of total CLE credit.  Of these, 0.0 qualify as 
hours of credit for ethics/professionalism.  
 
NY CLE Credit:  6.0 substantive credits (pursuant to the approved jurisdiction policy). 
 
PA CLE Credit:  5.0 substantive credits ($7.50 mandatory registration fee required). 
 


